Veldran, Katherine

Monica McFarland <monica@faninabox.com>
5/20/2014 4:07:22 PM

RE: Update - jacket invoice
sc-commerce-jackets-rev.pdf

Monica,

They never received the attached invoice. They are having it rushed now.
Please reference below.

Thank you,

Katherine

We never received this, will put it thought rush. Should receive payment in a week, 2 latest.
Thanks!

Lindsey Smulders (Welsh) | Wasserman Media Group
P: 416-214-6103, ext.225 |

From: Monica McFarland [mailto:monica@faninabox.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 20, 2014 1:47 PM

To: Veldran, Katherine

Subject: Re: Update - jacket invoice

Hi Katherine,

I haven't heard back from you on this payment.

I will be forced to charge the card you gave me if | don't have payment information by the end of today.
Please advise -

Thank you,

fecminafcox.coin

Monica McFarland
Office Manager
monica@faninabox.com
toll free:855-837-7444
fax: 559.255.8179

www.faninabox.com
Get Social With Us...

On 5/15/2014 6:35 AM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

I will follow up with RBC.
Thanks, KV

Katherine Veldran
Office of Governor Nikki Haley
803-767-7583


mailto:Veldran,%2520Katherine
mailto:monica@faninabox.com
mailto:monica@faninabox.com
mailto:monica@faninabox.com
http://www.pro-screen.com
https://www.facebook.com/pages/Fan-in-a-Box/244748552214024?sk=wall
http://www.pinterest.com/pin/173177548145516647/

On May 14, 2014, at 2:02 PM, "Monica McFarland" <monica@faninabox.com> wrote:

Katherine - We have yet to be paid on this invoice and it was due on receipt. Can you
please update me?
Thanks,
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Monica McFarland
Office Manager
monica@faninabox.com
toll free:855-837-7444
fax: 559.255.8179

www.faninabox.com
Get Social With Us...
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0On 4/29/2014 9:41 AM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

The payment will come from Lindsey Smulders with the Wasserman Media
Group. | have sent them the invoice when you forwarded it to me.

Katherine Veldran
Office of Governor Nikki Haley
803-767-7583

On Apr 29, 2014, at 11:18 AM, "Monica McFarland" <monica@faninabox.
com> wrote:

Katherine - | would like to process payment on this. Do you have
the payment information from the below people?

Thank you,
Monica McFarland
Office Manager

Fan in a Box, LLC
855-837-7444

www . Faninabox.com

Think INSIDE the Box!

On 4/23/2014 12:30 PM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

Please update the jacket invoice attached:

BILL TO:

Lindsey Smulders

Wasserman Media Group

77 King Street West, North Tower
Suite 4020, PO Box 250

Toronto, Ontario M5K 1J5

Thank you,
Katherine

Katherine F. Veldran
Director of Legislative Affairs | Office of Governor
Nikki Haley
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