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[ Brenda James - Fwd: RE: FOIA Request _ Page 1 _

From: Brandy Putnam

To: Brenda James; Jeff Stensland
Date: 12/11/2007 7:56 am
Subject: Fwd: RE: FOIA Request

This FOIA request was sent to me via e-mail. Can you please log it and send the blue sheet down for me to complete.
Thanks!

Brandy Putnam

Department of Health and Human Services
Phone Number (803)-898-1016

Fax Number (803)-255-8228

>>> "David E. Selander, CPA" Aamsa@_,m:num..noav 12/10/2007 2:25 PM >>>
Hi Brandy,

Please send hard copies to the address below at your earliest convenience.

Kind Regards,
David

US Treasury Circular 230 Notice: Any tax advice included in this written or
electronic communication was not intended or written to be used, and it
cannot be used by the taxpayer, for the purpose of avoiding any penalties
that may be imposed on the taxpayer by any governmental taxing authority or
agency.

David E. Selander, CPA

Hood & Selander

Certified Public Accountants
Professional Association

198 East Bay Street, Suite 100
Charleston, SC 29401

PH 843-577-6622

FX 843-577-0232

TOLL FREE 800-758-6079

From: Brandy Putnam [mai
Sent: Monday, December 10, 2007 12:41 PM
To: CPA David E. Selander
Subject: Re: FOIA Request

David,

We do not e-mail electronic copies of the cost report. Please let me know if
you would like me to send you hard copies of the cost report. Once I get
your response I will forward the request and the information on to our FOI
office for them to process the request and send it to you. Thanks!

Brandy Putnam

Department of Health and Human Services
Phone Number (803)-898-1016

Fax Number (803)-255-8228

>>> "David E. Selander, CPA" <David .com> 12/10/2007 7:25 AM >>>

Hi Brandy,
Debbie Myers directed me to you.
1 am making a request of information through the freedom of information act.



| Brenda James - Fwd: RE: FOIA Request

Page 2}

Piease email me the cost reports for:

Georgetown Healthcare and Rehab, Inc. (Mcd # 0633NF) (Mcr # 42-5048)
For the years ending 09/30/06, 09/30/05 and C9/30/04.

If possible please email the cost reports electronic cost report. ,

Please call if you have any questions. My contact information is below.

Kind Regards,

David

David E. Selander, CPA

Hood & Selander, CPA's PA
198 East Bay Street, Suite 100
Charleston, SC 29401

PH 843-577-6622

FX 843-577-0232



State of FBouth Carolina
Bepartment of Health and Hurman Serfrices

Mark Sanford Emma Forkner
Governor Director

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

N H H H P &

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235
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State of Fouth Carolina
Bepartment of Health and Hunvan Serbices

Mark Sanford Emma Forkner
Govemor Director

December 17, 2007

David E. Selander, CPA

Hook & Selander

198 East Bay Street, Suite 100
Charleston, SC 29401

Dear Mr. Selander:

In response to your recent Freedom of Information Act request, enclosed you will find
the billing for processing the information you requested from our office.

I hope this information is helpful to you. If you should have any questions, please
contact Brandy Putnam at (803) 898-1016.

Sincerely,

it L el

William L. Wells, CPA
Deputy Director

WLW/bep

Enclosures

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



State of FBouth Carolina
Bepartment of Health and Humen Serbices

Mark Sanford Emma Forkner
Govemnor Director

December 17, 2007

TO: David E. Selander, CPA, Hood & Selander
FROM: William L. Wells, CPA
Deputy Director

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request # 287

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:
Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour 1 Hours $10.00
Pages copied at $.10 per page 122 Pages $12.20
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $_
Shipping and Handling Costs $. 400
Other costs associated with the FOIA request: ___ $

Total Amount Due SCDHHS: $26.20

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs .

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please oo:ﬁmoﬁwnmﬁv\ Putnam at (803) 898-1016 should you have any questions.

At 7~ Ll (233 /o 7

Signature Date’

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



