Stokes-Murray, Lynn <LStokes-Murray@MCNAIR.NET>
Danny VaratDannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov

10/6/2017 1:02:44 PM

Fwd: banquet meal cost

Here you go.
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Tina Cota <tcota@ngasc.org>

Date: October 6, 2017 at 12:49:53 PM EDT

To: "LStokes-Murray@MCNAIR.NET" <LStokes-Murray@MCNAIR.NET>
Cc: Lawrence Crowson <Icrowson@ngasc.org>

Subject: banquet meal cost

Hey, Lynn | hope al has been well with you. Larry asked me to look up the information for you, requested below.
The banquet meal for last year’s conference was $33.50 a person. If you need additional information please let me
know. Have awonderful weekend.

TinaN. Cota

Insurance Program Administrator/ Office Manager
National Guard Association Of South Carolina
132 Pickens St. Columbia, SC 29205
803-254-8456

Email: tcota@ngasc.org

From: Stokes-Murray, Lynn <L Stokes-Murray@M CNAIR.NET>
Sent: Wednesday, October 4, 2017 11:01 AM

To: Lawrence Crowson

Subject: Fwd: Natl Guard Banquet

Can you give me this number?
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Danny Varat <DannyV arat@scstatenouse.gov>

Date: October 4, 2017 at 10:20:32 AM EDT

To: "Stokes-Murray, Lynn" <L Stokes-Murray @M CNAIR.NET>
Subject: Natl Guard Banquet

Can you please send me the value of the banquet meal for our reporting purposes? Thanks
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PRIVILEGE AND CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This communication (including any attachments) is being sent by or on behalf of a lawyer or law firm and may
contain confidential or legally privileged information. The sender does not intend to waive any privilege, including the attorney-client privilege, that may attach to
this communication. If you are not the intended recipient, you are not authorized to intercept, read, print, retain, copy, forward or disseminate this communication.
If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by email and delete this communication and all copies.



