
From: Shane Massey <ShaneMassey@scsenate.gov>
To: Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov

Soura, ChristianChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov
Date: 5/14/2013 12:17:02 PM

Subject: FW: budget

Do y’all have the 1099 for the SEWE director?
 
From: Shane Massey 
 
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2013 12:01 PM
 
To: 'christiansoura@gov.sc.gov'
 
Subject: budget
 
Where is the $1M in additional money for grants to the Arts Commission?
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