From: Kester, Tony
To:  Theriot, Susan <stheriot@aging.sc.gov>
Taylor, Tommy <tltaylor@aging.sc.gov>
Date:  7/24/2013 7:44:00 AM
Subject:  FW: 3024 / HRPAY

From: Scott, Keith

Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2013 10:00 AM
To: Kester, Tony; Ellison, Ruchelle

Cc: Griffin, Anjali; Taylor, Tommy
Subject: RE: 3024 / HRPAY

Hello,

The $.01 balance in fund 30240000 appeared after payroll document # 6100915918 posted on 5/31/13. This balance
also appearsin STARS. Please complete a journal entry to reclass this amount to the appropriate fund.

Thanks,
Keith Scott

From: Griffin, Anjali

Sent: Friday, July 19, 2013 1:17 PM
To: Kester, Tony

Cc: Scott, Keith

Subject: 3024 / HRPAY

Hello,
Please review the attached and clear the balances no later than noon on Monday.

Anjali Griffin, CPA

Senior Assistant Comptroller General
agriffin@cg.sc.gov

Phone: 803-734-2609

Fax: 803-734-1765

1200 Senate Street

305 Wade Hampton Office Building
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