Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
Adams, Chaney <ChaneyAdams@gov.sc.gov>
Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov>

Godfrey, Rob <RobGodfrey@gov.sc.gov>

3/7/2016 4:15:11 PM

RE: | forgot to ask....

Receipt for Payment.pdf

A receipt was the second page of her packet. A copy of the receipt is also attached.

From: Adams, Chaney

Sent: Monday, March 07, 2016 4:14 PM
To: Schimsa, Rebecca; Pisarik, Holly
Cc: Godfrey, Rob

Subject: FW: | forgot to ask....

From: Adcox, Seanna M. [mailto:SAdcox@ap.org]
Sent: Monday, March 07, 2016 4:12 PM

To: Adams, Chaney

Subject: | forgot to ask....

Can | get a receipt for the FOIA check, so | can submit it to get reimbursed?

Seanna
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