Edwin McCain <thegreatnomad@aol.com>
Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov
Robin McCainrobin_mccain@hotmail.com
10/9/2014 7:03:16 PM

Fwd: Yukon Delta

Robin meet Katherine. She's with the Governors office. She is going to help us with this boat
situation.

I'm standing in the rain wiring this email at football practice sorry it's short
E
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov>

Date: October 7, 2014 at 1:27:43 PM EDT

To: "thegreatnomad@aol.com™ <thegreatnomad@aol.com>
Subject: RE: Yukon Delta

I am sorry for the continuing difficulty in trying to get this boat registered. | will ask my supervisor the below
question and let you know. ]

From: thegreatnomad@aol.com [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Tuesday, October 07, 2014 1:24 PM

To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

Hola Amanda,

I reached out to Ted Vess and his wife last week and haven't heard back. From what | understand Nancy Harvey is the
daughter of the man that owned the boat. She originally brought it to Ted to see if it could be fixed. When she found
out how much it would cost she basically gave up on the idea and left the boat at Ted's farm. She has helped with the
bill of sale and | am hopeful that she can provide this next document but if it requires her going to the courthouse | fear
she may simply say no. We are about to begin filming the next episode in November and | really can't spend much
more time on this myself. What if | just give the boat back to Nancy as a "pay it forward" kind of gesture. It would solve
the problem of registration for me and make her extremely happy. | can always use some Karma in the bank! | would
however keep the motor. We can re use it in the upcoming build. Can you simply register the motor for me? You
should have the certificate of origin with all of the other paperwork | sent.

| promise moving forward that | won't purchase any boat without proper title and bill of sale documentation.
Thanks again,

Edwin

From: Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov>
To: 'thegreatnomad@aol.com' <thegreatnomad@aol.com>
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Sent: Tue, Oct 7,2014 11:39 am
Subject: RE: Yukon Delta

Just checking the status of this. J

From: thegreatnomad@aol.com [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Thursday, October 02, 2014 12:30 PM

To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

| have sent them the message. Correct me if | am wrong but | paid the fee with you over the phone with a credit card
and the watercraft application was in the original paperwork. Technically Nancy sold the boat to Ted who then sold it to
me. Not sure if that helps but just wanted to point that out.

Thanks again,

From: Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov>

To: 'thegreatnomad@aol.com' <thegreatnomad@aol.com>
Sent: Thu, Oct 2, 2014 11:23 am

Subject: RE: Yukon Delta

Ok, | have reviewed this with my supervisor and she told me to email you and see if you could also get the
documentation from Clerk of Courts office in NC showing Nancy Harvey as the administrator of Walter Harvey's estate,
since Walter is deceased and Nancy sold you the vessel. This should be all that we will need to process your
paperwork. (except your fee and your watercraft application, but that will be sent to you after you get the above

mentioned documents and after my supervisor reviews it again) J

From: thegreatnomad@aol.com [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Friday, September 26, 2014 11:29 AM

To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

Just spoke with her. She said she emailed it to you this morning. In any event she brought it with her today just in
case and she is going to take a picture of it and send it to me. | will forward along to you.

From: Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov>
To: 'Edwin McCain' <thegreatnomad@aol.com>
Sent: Fri, Sep 26, 2014 10:46 am

Subject: RE: Yukon Delta

No | have not received it yet

From: Edwin McCain [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Friday, September 26, 2014 10:42 AM

To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

Just checking in to be sure you received the bill of sale.
E

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 25, 2014, at 2:10 PM, Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov> wrote:
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OKIE DOKIE J

From: Edwin McCain [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 25, 2014 2:06 PM

To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

10-4. Working on that now.

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 25, 2014, at 1:02 PM, Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov> wrote:

If she can fax it and you email me the photos then we can get the ball rolling sooner. But
really whatever is easiest for her. Fax #: 803-734-3897

From: thegreatnomad@aol.com [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 25, 2014 11:40 AM

To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

Hey Amanda,

Ted's wife got the bill of sale for me. She can fax it to you or mail it to you. What would
you prefer?

We are in the home stretch!

From: Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov>
To: 'Edwin McCain' <thegreatnomad@aol.com>
Sent: Wed, Sep 24, 2014 12:18 pm

Subject: RE: Yukon Delta

© | live that song...it brings all those High School memories back....maybe | should shut up
I'm showing my age J

From: Edwin McCain [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 24, 2014 12:09 PM

To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

Yes it is. Thank God for that song!
E
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 24, 2014, at 11:57 AM, Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov> wrote:

Iwould love to see it but I'll have to let my supervisor know and get back to
you on that...this might be a stupid question but is this the “I'll Be” Edwin
McCain?

From: Edwin McCain [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 24, 2014 11:53 AM

To: Amanda Purvis
Subject: Re: Yukon Delta
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Amanda,

| am playing a gig at the Governors mansion on Friday. | can come in early
and come to your offices and show you the Yukon Delta episode so it makes
more sense.

Let me know if you're interested. | would love to meet everyone. | have a
feeling were gonna need your help again as the season progresses.

Standing by,
E
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 24, 2014, at 11:41 AM, Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov>
wrote:

We need the bill of sale when Mr. Vess purchased the boat. It
should look something like gave/sold
(for this price) this boat(describe the boat) to Mr. Vess (on this
date). And have the man that he purchased it from needs to
sign it.

From: Edwin McCain [mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 24, 2014 11:37 AM

To: Amanda Purvis
Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

Hey Amanda,

| just hung up with Teds wife. She asked me to fax a bill of sale
for the former owners to sign. What does that document need
to include?

Should it be a bill of sale to Ted Vess orto me? There really
wasn't any money exchanged so should it just be an affidavit
that they gave the boat to him? | have a fax number for them
so | should be able to take care of it today. | just wantto be
sure | get exactly what you need.

E
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 24, 2014, at 9:14 AM, Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.
sc.gov> wrote:

Just checking in on the status of this paperwork.

From: Edwin McCain
[mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]

Sent: Wednesday, September 17, 2014 1:33 PM
To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

| spoke with Mr. Vess and he is in the process of
getting a bill of sale from the former owner. | will
pass along as soon as | hear from him.

Thanks,

Edwin
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Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 17, 2014, at 10:33 AM, Amanda Purvis
<PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov> wrote:

Good Morning Mr. McCain

| was just emailing you to get a
status on the additional paperwork
that we needed.

From: Edwin McCain
[mailto:thegreatnomad@aol.com]
Sent: Friday, September 05, 2014
1:40 PM

To: Amanda Purvis

Subject: Re: Yukon Delta

10-4.
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 5, 2014, at 1:36 PM,
Amanda Purvis <PurvisA@dnr.sc.
gov> wrote:

It's not a form he can
just get them to hand
write a bill of sale

From: Edwin McCain
[mailto:thegreatnoma
d@aol.com]

Sent: Friday,
September 05, 2014
1:35 PM

To: Amanda Purvis
Subject: Re: Yukon
Delta

Sorry, one more
thing. Can you send
me a PDF of the form
he needs to get from
them?

E
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 5, 2014, at
1:27 PM, Amanda
Purvis
<PurvisA@dnr.sc.
gov> wrote:

Ok
Sounds
good.
J

From:
Edwin
McCain
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[mailto:thegreatnomad
@aol.
com]
Sent:
Friday,
Septem
ber 05,
2014
1:26
PM

To:
Amand
a
Purvis
Subjec
t: Re:
Yukon
Delta

No big
deal. |

will be
more
prepare
d next
time. |
am
going
to be
out of
touch
for 7
days
but will
get to
work on
this as
soon as
| return.

E

Sent
from
my
iPhone

On Sep
5

2014,
at 1:16
PM,
Amand
a
Purvis
<Purvis
A@dnr.
sc.gov>
wrote:

No
hassle
for

me

sir
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this

is

my

job

J

I'm
sorry
that

I
cannot
make
the
process
more
easy
for

you

J

From

Edwin
McCain

mailto
thegreatnomad
aol

com

]

Sent
Friday

September
05

2014
15
PM
To

Amanda
Purvis

Subject
Re

Yukon
Delta
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sure
he
can

Let
me
get
to
work
on
that
when

get
back

Sorry
This
has
been
such
a
hassle
for
you

Sent
from

my
iPhone

On
Sep
5

2014

at
10

03
AM

Amanda
Purvis
<

PurvisA
@
dnr

SC

gov
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wrote

Is
there
any
way
that
Mr

Vess
can
get

in
contact
with
the
people
that
gave
him
the
boat
and
just

a

bill

of
sale
that
states
gift

?

From

Edwin
McCain

mailto
thegreatnomad
@

aol

com

]

Sent
Wednesday

September
03

2014

14
PM

To

Amanda
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Purvis
Subject
Re

Yukon
Delta

Hey
Amanda

I

am
headed
out

of

town
for

a

week

I

will
get
that
pic

to
you
when
I
return

Mr

Vess
(ljidn

buy
the
boat

The
people
that
owned
it
before
just
gave

it

to

him

Not



really
sure

what
to
on
that
note

Thanks

Edwin

Sent
from

my
iPhone

On
Sep

2014

at

25
PM

Amanda
Purvis

<
PurvisA

Q@

dnr
sc

gov

wrote

I

am
emailing
you
because
we

need
some
additiona
information
/

photos


mailto:PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov
mailto:PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov
mailto:PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov
mailto:PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov
mailto:PurvisA@dnr.sc.gov

Can
you
please
email

close

up
photo

where
the

hull

ID

is
located
now

&

the
original
photo
of

the

hull

id
number
that
you
sent

in

with
your
paperwork

the

one
showing
where
you
sanded
the
number
a

little

bit

).

Also

this

boat

is

not
registered
in

North
Carolina
to

the

man

that

you
purchased
it

from



so
we
will
also
need
a

bill
of
sale
from
Mr

Vess

for

when

he
purchased
the

boat

Thank
you
for

all
your
help

in

this
matter

Amanda
Purvis
South
Carolina
Department
of

Natural
Resources
Marine
Theft
Investigative
Section
Mailing

p
O

Box
167
Columbia

SC
29202
Location

1000
Assembly
St



Columbia
SC

29201
Phone

803-734-3858
Fax

803-734-3897



