
From: Soura, Christian
To: Baker, Josh <JoshBaker@gov.sc.gov>

Date: 12/14/2012 1:21:30 PM
Subject: FW: Final Items for Budget

 
 
 
Christian L. Soura
Deputy Chief of Staff
 
(803) 543-0792
ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov
 
From: Toomey, Bob 

Sent: Friday, December 14, 2012 12:11 PM

To: Soura, Christian

Cc: liggettp@scdhhs.gov

Subject: RE: Final Items for Budget
 

Christian, 
 
Funds to be invested in improvements to capacity and quality of A&D treatment. 
Wailing treatment leads to recovery, and folks in recovery and their families have markedly better health status 
and lower health expenditure. 
 
Likely first year investments include medical record management system, renovations and equipment to launch 
Family Care Centers, and some critical training and continuing education for field.
 
There is also a proposal to investigate and intervene in world of prescription drug abuse and use psychotropic 
meds with children and adolescents.
 
Pete...please let me know if this missed mark in any major way.
Thanks,  bob

Sent from my Samsung Galaxy Note™, an AT&T LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

Subject: RE: Final Items for Budget

From: "Soura, Christian" <ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov>

To: "Toomey, Bob" <btoomey@daodas.sc.gov>

CC: RE: Final Items for Budget


                Perfect – thanks.  We’ll process it today.
 
CLS
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Christian L. Soura
Deputy Chief of Staff
 
(803) 543-0792
ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov
 
From: Toomey, Bob 

Sent: Friday, December 14, 2012 10:53 AM

To: Soura, Christian

Subject: RE: Final Items for Budget
 
Christian, 
Yes $3 million is good for other funds authorization. 
Yes to same amount for transfer to DHHS.
 
Will send quick summary after talking with Pete Liggett.
 
Thanks Bob


Sent from my Samsung Galaxy Note™, an AT&T LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

Subject: Final Items for Budget

From: "Soura, Christian" <ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov>

To: "Toomey, Bob" <btoomey@daodas.sc.gov>

CC: Final Items for Budget

Bob,
 
                We’re closing up the budget book, and I wanted to check-in briefly on a couple of points:
 

1.       How much do we need to raise your Other Funds authorization by in order to let you expend the pharma 
settlement proceeds from HHS?  It sounds like it’s somewhere between $2.5M and $3M?

2.       Do you have a sentence or two that summarizes your intended use of those funds?
3.       For Proviso 25.4, Medicaid Match Transfer, is $1,915,902 still the dollar amount you want to see, or has it 

changed?
 

If you could have someone answer these in the next few hours, it would be helpful.  Sorry for the short 
notice…it’s a little hectic as we get close to finishing up.  Thanks.

 
CLS
 
 
Christian L. Soura
Deputy Chief of Staff
 
(803) 543-0792
ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov
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