
From: Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
To: Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov

Date: 4/6/2018 7:19:19 AM
Subject: Re: Invoices

​Thanks


From: Catherine McNicoll
 
Sent: Thursday, April 5, 2018 4:30 PM
 
To: Danny Varat
 
Subject: FW: Invoices 
 
PSA Payment update
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
 
From: Ellison, Ruchelle [mailto:rellison@aging.sc.gov] 
 
Sent: Thursday, April 05, 2018 12:20 PM
 
To: Catherine McNicoll 
Subject: RE: Invoices
 
Catherine,
 
His check is being mailed today.
 
Thanks.
 

Ruchelle W. Ellison
Finance Manager
South Carolina Lieutenant Governor’s Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350
Columbia, SC 29201
Work: (803) 734-9883 Fax: (803) 734-9886
rellison@aging.sc.gov
 
 
 
From: Catherine McNicoll [mailto:CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov] 
 
Sent: Thursday, April 5, 2018 11:17 AM
 
To: Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
 
Subject: Re: Invoices
 
​Rochelle, Are we good on this?
 
-Catherine

From: Catherine McNicoll
 
Sent: Friday, March 30, 2018 12:21 PM
 
To: 'Ellison, Ruchelle'
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Subject: RE: Invoices 
 
Good Afternoon Ruchelle, I think I properly corrected the requisition before Danny signed. I noticed the 1200 was not 
there. Please let me know if I’m missing something. The cost will come out of our admin/operation funds over here. 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
 
From: Ellison, Ruchelle [mailto:rellison@aging.sc.gov] 
 
Sent: Friday, March 30, 2018 11:56 AM
 
To: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov>
 
Cc: Broome, Darryl <dbroome@aging.sc.gov>
 
Subject: RE: Invoices
Catherine,
 
Please get Danny to sign off on the attached requisitions. And are they being paid from your account or another 
funding source?
 
Thanks Catherine.
 
Ruchelle
 
 
 

Ruchelle W. Ellison
Finance Manager
South Carolina Lieutenant Governor’s Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350
Columbia, SC 29201
Work: (803) 734-9883 Fax: (803) 734-9886
rellison@aging.sc.gov
 
 
 
From: Catherine McNicoll [mailto:CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov] 
 
Sent: Thursday, March 29, 2018 9:52 AM
 
To: Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
 
Cc: Broome, Darryl <dbroome@aging.sc.gov>
 
Subject: Fwd: Invoices
Good Morning Rochelle,
 
Attached are two invoices for the production of two drug take back PSAs. Please let me know what additional 
documentation you need and I will get it to you ASAP. We would like to get these paid ASAP. Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)
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Sent from my iPhone
 

---------- Forwarded message ----------
 
From: "Danny Varat" <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
 
Date: Thu, Mar 29, 2018 at 9:21 AM -0400
 
Subject: Invoices
 
To: "Catherine McNicoll" <CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov>
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