
From: Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
To: Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov

Date: 9/28/2017 3:06:18 PM
Subject: Fw: [Scan] 2017-09-03 07:25:59

Attachments: 2017-09-03 07-25-59.pdf
ATT00001.htm

Was this handled?


From: Kevin Bryant 
Sent: Sunday, September 3, 2017 7:26 AM
 
To: Lily Cogdill; Danny Varat
 
Subject: [Scan] 2017-09-03 07:25:59 
 
Does this count for reimbursement?
 
--
 
Sent with Genius Scan (+) for iOS.
 
http://dl.tglapp.com/genius-scan
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