
From: Soura, Christian
To: Shane Massey <ShaneMassey@scsenate.gov> 

Veldran, Katherine <KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov>
Date: 5/14/2013 12:21:15 PM 

Subject: RE: budget

On the 1st question, it's in the Arts Commission (Section 28):

II. Statewide Arts Services > Distribution to Subdivisions > Distribution to Subdivisions (line increased by $1.03M
against FY 2012-13 levels)...the other $30,000 is that SC Artist/Entrepreneurs program.

Working on #2...few minutes.

CLS

Christian L. Soura
Deputy Chief of Staff

(803) 543-0792 
ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov

From: Shane Massey [mailto:ShaneMassey@scsenate.gov] 
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2013 12:17 PM 
To: Veldran, Katherine; Soura, Christian 
Subject: FW: budget

Do y'all have the 1099 for the SEWE director?

From: Shane Massey
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2013 12:01 PM 
To: 'christiansoura@gov.sc.gov' 
Subject: budget

Where is the $1M in additional money for grants to the Arts Commission?
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