Symmes, Brian <BrianSymmes@gov.sc.gov>
Godfrey, RobRobGodfrey@gov.sc.gov
Adams, ChaneyChaneyAdams@gov.sc.gov
10/2/2015 9:27:19 AM

Fwd: Questions

Need some direction for Stephanie on this.
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Smith, Austin" <AustinSmith@gov.sc.gov>

Date: October 1, 2015 at 6:11:12 PM EDT

To: "Symmes, Brian" <BrianSymmes@gov.sc.gov>

Cc: "Godfrey, Rob" <RobGodfrey@gov.sc.gov>, "Adams, Chaney" <ChaneyAdams@gov.sc.
gov>

Subject: Re: Questions

Looks good to me.

On Oct 1, 2015, at 5:46 PM, Symmes, Brian <BrianSymmes@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

From: Stephanie Givens (C055503) [mailto:Givens.Stephanie@doc.sc.gov]
Sent: Thursday, October 01, 2015 4:56 PM

To: Symmes, Brian

Subject: Questions

The statement did not satisfy Tim’s inquiry. See below:

are there any other private companies still using the service program and if so, how are they distinguished
from the three that were moved out? (There are 3 recycling companies that remain, they were certified by
commerce. I'm in the process of acquiring the paperwork).

And do "other expenses” on your spreadsheet include lease/rental costs? | know the director had said
these companies are charged for the space they use. (yes they do)

Lastly, do any of these net losses include amounts owed to the department? In other words, even if an
account shows a net loss, does that mean SCDC has collected all of its charges, such as for rent, utilities,
security? (Checking on this)

Thanks!

Tim

Thanks!
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Tim

Stephanie Givens

Communications Director

S.C. Department of Corrections

M: (803) 960-7088
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