
From: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov> 
To: 'Kimberly Harmon' <kharmon@wrcog.org>

ssmith@wrcog.org <ssmith@wrcog.org>
CC: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>

Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>
Date: 11/26/2014 5:15:36 PM

Subject: RE: Waccamaw - Services PRF - October 2014

Dear Ms. Smith and Ms. Harmon:

The LGOA is in receipt of the Waccamaw PSA's PRF for October Services. The PRF is being returned because column
(i) shows a negative balance for IIID13. Please revised the PRF and submit with a current date.

Let us know via financehelp@aging.sc.gov if you have additional questions and concerns.

Thank you for your continued partnership in our mission to enhance the lives of South Carolina's seniors and adults
with disabilities.

Finance Team
South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350
Columbia, SC 29201

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or
otherwise protected from disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this
electronic mail or its contents by persons other than the intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email so that we may correct our 
internal records. Please then delete the original message.

Ruchelle Ellison
Fiscal Manager
South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350
Columbia, SC 29201
Phone 803-734-9883 Fax 803-9886
rellison@aging.sc.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or otherwise protected from
disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this electronic mail or its contents by persons other than the 
intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email so 
that we may correct our internal records. Please then delete the original message.

From: Kimberly Harmon [mailto:kharmon@wrcog.org]
Sent: Wednesday, November 19, 2014 12:30 PM
To: Finance Help, Aging
Subject: Fwd: Waccamaw - Services PRF - October 2014

Send before all attachments were made. Please see below with additional attachments. Kim
----------Forwarded message ----------
From: Kimberly Harmon <kharmon@wrcog.org>
Date: Wed, Nov 19, 2014 at 12:28 PM
Subject: Waccamaw - Services PRF - October 2014
To: "Finance Help, Aging" <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>
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Attached is the Services PRF for October 2014 as well as MUSRs for IIIB-IIID, HCBS/BINGO, IIIE,
Alz/RNR, LG106alln, LG106alzn, LG106en, LG106rnrn. If you have any questions, please let me know. 
Thanks. Kim
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Kimberly Harmon
Aging Director
(O) 843.546.8502 ext. 1259
(F) 843.527.2302
kharmon@wrcog.org | www.wrcog.org

Kimberly Harmon
Aging Director
(O) 843.546.8502 ext. 1259
(F) 843.527.2302
kharmon@wrcog.org | www.wrcog.org

This e-mail, in its entirety and including all attachments, is intended solely for the use of the person or entity to whom it is addressed and may contain sensitive 
information which is privileged, confidential, and the disclosure of which is governed by applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby 

notified that disclosing, distributing, copying, or taking any action in relation to this e-mail is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you have received this e-mail in error, 
please notify the sender immediately and destroy the related message and any attachments.

WARNING: All e-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to public disclosure under the South Carolina Freedom of Information Act (FOIA), 
§30-410 SC Code of Laws
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