
From: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov> 
To: Watson, Dale <dwatson@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>

Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>
Date: 11/10/2014 9:31:25 AM 

Subject: FW: R7 PD Admin PRF(October 2014)
Attachments: R7 PD Admin PRF(October 2014).pdf

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare 
(K:\\PSA\\PRFs\\FY15\\Pee Dee).

Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond ASAP.

From: Mark Smith [mailto:Mark.Smith@caresouth-carolina.com] 
Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 6:21 AM 
To: Finance Help, Aging
Cc: Shelia Welch; Mark Smith
Subject: R7 PD Admin PRF(October 2014)
Importance: High

Attached is the Payment Request Form for Admin October 2014. 

Copy sent to Shelia Welch.

Mark Smith, Fiscal Analyst
Vantage Point,a division of CareSouth Carolina, Inc.
Pee Dee Regional Aging and Disability Resource Center
843-383-8632 Office
843-383-8754 Fax

Confidentiality Note

This message is intended for the use of the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information, including health information, that is privileged, 
confidential, and the disclosure of which is governed by applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent 
responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this information is STRICTLY
PROHIBITED.

If you have received this in error, please notify us immediately and destroy the related message.
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