SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov

3/11/2016 11:11:53 AM

RE: follow up

Great, thanks!

Dana Bruce Fulmer

SC Flood Relief Fund

Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601

F. 803.799.6663

From: Pisarik, Holly [mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Friday, March 11, 2016 10:47 AM

To: SC Flood Fund

Subject: RE: follow up

I’m checking to see if we have anything from the press conference.

From: SC Flood Fund [mailto:scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org]
Sent: Friday, March 11, 2016 10:17 AM

To: Pisarik, Holly

Subject: follow up

Did you see my question regarding banners or signs for One SC as relates to the state agency’s
fundraiser? Do you have any materials they could pick up? We have not made a sign or banner per
say.

Dana Bruce Fulmer

SC Flood Relief Fund

Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601

F. 803.799.6663
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