From: SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
To: Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov
CC: JoAnn TurnquistJoAnn@yourfoundation.org
Date:  1/20/2016 10:41:24 AM
Subject:  RE: Fund total

Holly,

Just giving you an acknowledgement that | received this and will get back to you by this afternoon
with totals. I’'m requesting the report on the fund balance minus expenses and grants. We discussed
and approved the second round of grants Friday the 15th. JoAnn will be sending you the grant report.

The third round will open in March to fund projects through the summer.

Per check presentations we are waiting on contact from two outstanding pledges that we felt were
noteworthy.

I’ll be in touch later this afternoon.

Dana Bruce Fulmer

SC Flood Relief Fund

Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601

F. 803.799.6663

From: Pisarik, Holly [mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2016 10:27 AM

To: SC Flood Fund

Subject: Fund total

Can | get an update on where we are on the fund:

Check totals to date

Amount of grants given out to date

Fund balance

When next rounds of grants will be

Has there been any progress on forming a Fund Raising Committee?

Any other thoughts from the group on an event?

After our last meeting, we thought you guys were going to send us a list of possible “check presentations.” Do you
guys have that together yet?

Thanks!

Holly G. Pisarik

Chief Legal Counsel

Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
0: 803-734-8465 C: 803-322-6255
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