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From: Monica McFarland <monica@faninabox.com>
To: Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov

Date: 3/18/2014 3:01:42 PM
Subject: Re: RBC logo

Attached is your invoice for the wind shirts as well as a credit card payment form you can fill out and 
send over.

Thanks,

Monica McFarland
Office Manager
Fan in a Box, LLC
855-837-7444
www.faninabox.com

Think INSIDE the Box!

On 3/18/2014 11:43 AM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

S-LX : 80 
XXL: 4

From: Monica McFarland [mailto:monica@faninabox.com]
Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2014 2:23 PM
To: Veldran, Katherine
Subject: Re: RBC logo

Do you have an idea of quantity? I can put in the invoice and then we can process a deposit and adjust later.

Monica McFarland
Office Manager
Fan in a Box, LLC
855-837-7444
www.faninabox.com

Think INSIDE the Box!

On 3/18/2014 11:20 AM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

Can you ask them the last possible date for us to give them the sizes to place the order? 
RBC is going to pay for them directly.
We can put down the deposit if need to proceed -  how should we go about doing that?
KV

From: Monica McFarland [mailto:monica@faninabox.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2014 1:58 PM 
To: Veldran, Katherine
Subject: Re: RBC logo
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mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov
http://www.faninabox.com
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Great! I need to process a deposit so do you know what quantities/sizes you will order? 
The transaction for the wind shirts will go through Fan in a Box, a sister company of Golf 
Tournament in a Box.

Thanks,

Monica McFarland
Office Manager
Fan in a Box, LLC
855-837-7444
www.faninabox.com

Think INSIDE the Box!

On 3/18/2014 10:33 AM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

Monica,
Below is information from RBC regarding the RBC logo. 
Please let me know if you have any questions.
Thank you,
Katherine

As for the logo on the shirt, as discussed we are ok removing ‘presented by Boeing'. 
Also note that the colours appear to be reversed, see below:
Correct (if RBC Heritage text is white, the RBC letters in shield need to be white)

Incorrect

Katherine F. Veldran
Director of Legislative Affairs | Office of Governor Nikki Haley 
O: 803-734-5124 | C: 803-767-7583 
KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov
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