
From: Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
To: Baker, Josh <JoshBaker@gov.sc.gov>

Soura, Christian <ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov>
CC: Pitts, Ted <TedPitts@gov.sc.gov>

Date: 6/19/2014 10:44:57 AM
Subject: FW: State Agency Non-Federal Cost Share

I will add this to the staff notes as is, unless either of you have corrections or additions to make.  Thank you.
 
From: Stenson, Kim [mailto:Kstenson@emd.sc.gov] 

Sent: Thursday, June 19, 2014 7:49 AM

To: Pitts, Ted

Cc: Schimsa, Rebecca; Batson, Steven; Ryan, Elizabeth; Denny, Morgan; Matt Nichols

Subject: State Agency Non-Federal Cost Share
 
Ted,
 
Per our conversation last week, below are our most current estimates for both state agency total costs and cost share 
costs.  Cost share is generally 25% with the exception of DOT which will be less than the estimates below due to a 
sliding scale on debris costs. DOT will get additional federal funding by removing debris within 90 days.
 
Agency                    Estimated Costs                   Non-Federal Share
Budget and Control Board $10,000 $2,500
Coastal Carolina University $60,000 $15,000
Department of Disabilities and Special Needs $43,569 $10,892
Department of Mental Health $10,000 $2,500
Department of Natural Resources $210,000 $52,500
Department of Parks, Recreation, and Tourism $290,238 $72,560
Department of Public Safety $910,000 $227,500
Department of Transportation $163,203,559 $40,800,890
Office of the Adjutant General $485,204 $121,301
South Carolina Emergency Management Division $58,433 $14,608
South Carolina Forestry Commission $24,521 $6,130
South Carolina Law Enforcement Division $12,991 $3,248
University of South Carolina - Aiken $34,298 $8,575
  

Total $165,352,813 $41,338,204
 
We have about $1.07M in old disaster accounts that could be used to cover the cost share for all state agencies less 
DOT.  Estimated cost share for state agencies, less DOT, is $537,314.  The authority to do so is covered under Proviso 
117.62 (GP: FEMA Flexibility).  Recommend you consider paying the state agency cost share for the February Winter 
Storm less DOT using funds in the old disaster account.
 
Let me know if you have any questions.
 
Regards,
 
Kim
 
Kim Stenson

Director
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