From: SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
To: Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov
Date:  3/16/2016 9:51:18 AM
Subject:  RE: Donation

Hi Holly,

I wanted to double check that it wasn’t in the queue to be deposited. We have not received anything
from Movement Mortgage. Also, given the extreme natural disasters elsewhere | think it would be
wonderful if the Governor could send a note to all past One SC Grant recipients thanking them—if
this hasn’t been done already. Would you like me to send you the contact list in excel?

Dana Bruce Fulmer

SC Flood Relief Fund

Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601

F. 803.799.6663

From: Pisarik, Holly [mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2016 9:58 AM

To: SC Flood Fund

Subject: Donation

Has Movement Mortgage donated to the fund?

Holly G. Pisarik

Chief Legal Counsel

Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
0: 803-734-8465 C: 803-322-6255
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