Monica McFarland <monica@golftournamentinabox.com>
Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov
4/9/2013 11:48:13 AM

RE: Signage

Hi Katherine,

So | now know why we haven't received a proof. They went directly into production with the order without sending a proof.
They have assured me that the artwork with the "presented by Boeing" looked good even on the smaller print area.

Even with them telling me that | have asked that they send me something so | can send it to you to review, so hopefully
they will send that to me shortly.

The lanyards are in production now so that they can ship tomorrow.
Thank you, Monica

From: Veldran, Katherine [mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Monday, April 08, 2013 1:37 PM

To: 'monica@golftournamentinabox.com’

Subject: Re: Signage

Thank you. Definitely worried about our timeline for the lanyards- considering we have not seen no proof with
either logo (with the Presented by Boeing and without) | have the card number for you.
Thank you, Katherine

From: Monica McFarland [mailto:monica@golftournamentinabox.com]
Sent: Monday, April 08, 2013 04:32 PM

To: Veldran, Katherine

Subject: RE: Signage

Hi Katherine,

I got your message.. I'm still waiting on an answer from the lanyard company. | just sent them an email to see if they
can expedite the proofing process.

I will let you know ASAP.

Thanks, Monica

From: Veldran, Katherine [mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Friday, April 05, 2013 7:36 AM

To: Christopher DeGraw

Cc: monica@golftournamentinabox.com

Subject: RE: Signage

Canyou do a call this morning?
Please call me when you are available?
803-767-7583

From: Christopher DeGraw [mailto:chris@golftournamentinabox.com]
Sent: Friday, April 05, 2013 10:35 AM

To: Veldran, Katherine

Cc: monica@golftournamentinabox.com

Subject: Re: Signage

Good morning,

Thanks for the approval on the signs. | will get them into production this morning. There are
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usually 8 grommets total on the 3x8 banner. If you need a certain amount then we can put as many
as you need. We do put directions in for the PVC kits. We always include directions for all our
signage. If there is anything else you need to know don't hesitate to ask.

Thanks

On 4/5/2013 6:09 AM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

Attached are the proofs that have been approved.
Please proceed with printing the following.

How many grommet will be on the 3 x8 banner?
Are there direction you can send me on how to put together the PVC kits with the signs?
Please let me know if you need anything else from me.

Thank you,
Katherine

From: Christopher DeGraw [mailto:chris@golftournamentinabox.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 03, 2013 6:11 PM

To: Veldran, Katherine

Subject: Re: RBC fast

No problem.

On 4/3/2013 3:08 PM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

Can you send me all finals for final approval to print?
Thanks, KV

From: Christopher DeGraw [mailto:chris@golftournamentinabox.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 03, 2013 5:27 PM

To: Veldran, Katherine

Subject: Re: RBC fast

Here is the proofs with the latest changes.

On 4/3/2013 1:25 PM, Veldran, Katherine wrote:

Thanks to our Event Partner, RBC, one of North America's leading
diversified financial services companies providing banking, wealth
management, insurance and capital markets services on a global
basis.
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Chris DeGraw

Graphic Designer
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