From: Adams, Chaney
To: Glaccum, David <DavidGlaccum@gov.sc.gov>
CC: Godfrey, Rob <RobGodfrey@gov.sc.gov>
Date:  11/30/2016 3:20:56 PM
Subject:  FW: follow up storm cost

David can you confirm these?

From: Prabhu, Maya [mailto:mprabhu@postandcourier.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 30, 2016 3:18 PM

To: Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: follow up storm cost

Hey Chaney,

Can you confirm the totals that the governor asked for in the budget last year? | have it as $72 million for public
assistance and $49 million for roads, to total $121 million. But for some reason the figure $114 million is in my head
from last year.

Can you check that for me?

Also, are you sending a statement from the governor? Or do you need a specific question for her to address?

Thanks!

~MTP

From: Adams, Chaney [mailto:ChaneyAdams@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, November 30, 2016 2:58 PM
Subject: follow up storm cost

Let me know what you might need from us on the record.
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