From: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>
To: Rivers, Denise <riversd@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Wolf, Anne <awolf@aging.sc.gov>
Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>
Date:  11/14/2014 10:16:43 AM
Subject:  FW: Able SC CDSMP PRF for October, 2014
Attachments: Able SC Payment Request Form - October.pdf

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare
(K:N\PSA\\PRFs\\FY15\\Able South Carolina).

Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond ASAP.

From: Sara Marin [mailto:SMarin@able-sc.org]
Sent: Thursday, November 13, 2014 10:46 AM
To: Finance Help, Aging

Subject: Able SC CDSMP PRF for October, 2014

Hello:
Attached you will find the October Payment Request Form.

Thank You,

Sara Marin

Director of Administration
Able South Carolina

Phone: 803.779.5121 Ext. 122
TTY: 803.779.0949

Toll Free: 800.681.6805

Fax: 803.779.5114

Email: smarin@able-sc.org

Visit us online at www.able-sc.org

Save The Date

November 7th, 2014
Columbia Conference Center
Tickets are $40 per person, click here to register.

NOTICE: This communication is confidential and intended only for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, you may not copy, disclose or distribute this message to anyone else; any such actions may be unlawful. If
you have received this communication in error, please contact the sender of the message to inform him or her of the
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error. Thank you.



