Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>

Broome, Darryldbroome@aging.sc.gov

Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov
3/17/2018 10:19:45 AM

Re: Drug Take Back Box

Should we reach out to them, too? We can do RCSD and CPD, but we have enough to do the others, too,
right?

From: Broome, Darryl

Sent: Friday, March 16, 2018 3:02 PM
To: Catherine McNicoll; Danny Varat
Subject: Re: Drug Take Back Box

Yes. We have several areas with no request so | think we should provide boxes for both of these in Central
Midlands.

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Catherine McNicoll

Sent: Friday, March 16, 2018 2:47:53 PM
To: Danny Varat

Cc: Broome, Darryl

Subject: FW: Drug Take Back Box

Please see Gerry’s email below. | also have a message that I’ m about to return from someone in RCSD about the Drop
Box.

Best Regards,

Catherine McNicoll

Director of Legal & Legidlative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll @SCSatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: Dickinson, Gerry [mailto:gdickinson@aging.sc.gov]
Sent: Friday, March 16, 2018 2:33 PM

To: Catherine McNicoll

Subject: FW: Drug Take Back Box

Isthe Central Midlands' AAA restricted to one take back box per county? Cindy has been contacted by Sheriff Lott
and CPD. But has not heard anything from her other counties. So would it be possible to give the other county
allotments to Richland County?

From: Cindy Curtis [mailto:ccurtis@centramidlands.org]
Sent: Friday, March 16, 2018 12:18 PM

To: Dickinson, Gerry <gdickinson@aging.sc.gov>
Subject: Fwd: Drug Take Back Box

Ho Gerry,
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I haven't heard back from Mgjor Hines at the City of Columbia Police Department in three months (see initial
and only email from 12/6/17). Now | have Richland County Sheriff Department working on obtaining a Take
Back Box.

I've heard nothing from Lexington, Newberry or Fairfield.
Am | restricted to one per county or isthere any flexibility?

Thank you,

Cindy Curtis

Cindy Curtis, MSW

Director, Area Agency on Aging

Central Midlands Council on Governments
236 Stoneridge Drive, Columbia, SC 29210
803.744.5134 Office (direct)

803.376.5390 Main

803.376.5394 Fax
ccurtis@centralmidlands.org

The Mission Statement of the AAA.ADRC isto promote a positive experience of aging for older individuals, the disabled community and
their families.

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Hines, Rick <rjhines@columbiasc.net>

Date: Wed, Dec 6, 2017 at 11:48 AM

Subject: Drug Take Back Box

To: "cecurtis@centralmidlands.org” <ccurtis@centralmidlands.org>

Cc: "Martin, Randy D" <rdmartin@columbiasc.net>, "Gilliam Jr, Ivey" <ilgilliam@columbiasc.net>,
"Williams, Christina" <cewilliams@columbiasc.net>

Ms. Curtis:;

The City of Columbia Police Department is interested in participating in your grant opportunity for Drug Take
Back Boxes. We understand that the take back box is a reimbursable expense totaling no more than $770 plus
tax only if purchased off of the www.takebackexpress.com vendor.

The City of Columbia Police Department understands that the unit should include a double-lock door and be
anchored to prevent retrieval and/or tampering of contents. It is also understood that the contents can only be
removed by authorized personnel and off-premises by an approved vendor under the standards set forth by the
Drug Enforcement Administration (DEA).

Aside from the costs of the box, it is understood that the Columbia Police Department is responsible for any and
all continuing costs for the operation and maintenance of the receptacle.

Thank you for this opportunity to participate in the drug take back box program.
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R. J. Hines- rolice Major

Columbia Police Department

Police Administrative Services Bureau
#1 Justice Square

Columbia, SC 29201

Office: (803) 545-3570

Cell: (803) 429-8093

Email: rjhines@columbiasc.net

‘Wwe Are Columbia

Thise-mail, inits entirety and including all attachments, isintended solely for the use of the person or entity to whomiit is addressed and
may contain sensitive information which is privileged, confidential, and the disclosure of which is governed by applicable law. If you are
not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that disclosing, distributing, copying, or taking any action in relation to this e-mail is
STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy the related message
and any attachments.

WARNING: All e-mail correspondence to and from this address may be subject to public disclosure under the South Carolina Freedom of
Information Act (FOIA), §30-410 SC Code of Laws.
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