Kester, Tony

Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
7/9/2014 6:46:19 AM

FW: Credit Card Payment Confirmation
Invoice-113501.pdf

Tony Kester

Aging Director

South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350

Columbia, SC 29201

Phone 803-734-9910, Fax 803-734-9886
kester@aging.sc.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or otherwise protected from
disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this electronic mail or its contents by persons other than the
intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email so
that we may correct our internal records. Please then delete the original message.

From: LivingDot [mailto:billing@livingdotsupport.com]
Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2014 5:26 AM

To: Kester, Tony
Subject: Credit Card Payment Confirmation

Dear Tony Kester (Office On Aging),
This is a payment receipt for Invoice 113501 sent on 07/04/2014
ONE - bgtime.org (07/09/2014 - 08/08/2014) $14.90 USD

Sub Total: $14.90 USD
Credit: $0.00 USD

Total: $14.90 USD

Amount: $14.90 USD
Transaction #: 6319654091
Total Paid: $14.90 USD
Remaining Balance: $0.00 USD

Status: Paid
You may review your invoice history at any time by logging in to your client area.
Note: This email will serve as an official receipt for this payment.

LivingDot, Inc.
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