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PIERCE, HERNS, SLOAN & McLEOD, LLC
THE BLAKE HOUSE

321 EAST BAY STREET Fol A
P.0O. BOX 22437, (29413) _
Charleston, South Carolina 29401 “ ,“.m.mm
PH: (843) 722-7733

FAX: (843) 722-7732

Date: Dot o, Za\\

To: NefE  STEmsams

Fax: 8o -29%-823%

From: Yoo OxGoew

RE: WeAageslbamd 0 Ccoess Agwaleg

File Number: ¥ z2z24%

Number of pages including Cover Sheet:__7 _

Message:

If you have any problems with the receipt of this fax, please call (843) 722-7733.

The information contained in the facsimile message is subject to attorney/cilent privilege and/or ritorney work
product privilege, and is confidential information intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above.
If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution, or copy of this commumnication Is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in ervor,

please immediarely notify us by telephone and return the original message to us at the above address via the US.
Postal Service. .

07/06/72011 12:17PM
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Prerce, HERNS, SLOAN & MCLEOD, LLC
CARLE. PIERCE, | M, TORD RAINSFQRD
LOUIS P IHERNS ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW AYESHA T WASHINGTON
ALLAN E SLOAN, Il STEPHENW, GAUSE

THE BLAKE HOUBE, 321 EAST BAY STREET
CHARLESTON, SOUTH CAROLINA 29401

W, MULUNS MeLEQD, JR. SONALY K. HENDRICKS ¥

JOSEPHG. WILSCM, IV WILSONW.GREENE A
JAMES G. KENNEDY POST OFFICE BOX 22437 ANIY FLPILLE
JAMES D. GANDY, I CHARLESTON, SOUTH GAROLINA 28413 EUZABETH R. HAMILTON
GEQRGEL. INABINET, JR KRISTEN B, FEHSENFELD
WILLIAM P BARLY (843) 722-7733

(843) 722-7732 FAX
# MEMBER SC & FL BAR www,phem.nal

4 CERTIFED BC CIRCUIT
GOURT MEDIATOR

t MEMBER SC, FL & GA BAH Direct [ial: (843) 725-7741
A MEMEER 5C &KY BAR E-mall: ryanoxford@phsnnct

* MEMBER SC, CO & WA BAR
July 6,2011

VIA FACSIMILE 803-255-8235 and US MAIL
SC Department of Health and Human Services

Bureau of Long Term Care Reimbursement

Attn: Jeff Stensland

P.O.Box 8206

Columbia, 8C 29202
Re: Medicaid Cost Reports for Heartland of West Ashley
1137 Sam Rittenberg Blvd., Charleston, SC 29407
Qur File Number: P2248.00

M, Stensland:

Please accept this letter as a request for documents pursuant to 8.C. Code Ann. § 30-4-10 et seq.
(Freedom of Information Act) and the applicable federal statutes and regulations, see e.g, S US.CA. §
552 and 29 CF.R. § 1610.7. Please provide the following information within ten (10) business days after
receipt of this request, or sooner, if possible:

All signed Medicaid Cost Reports for the above referenced facility for the fiscal
years ending in 2009 and 2010.

Tn making this request, we hereby certify that we assume financial liability for the direct costs of
the search for the requested records and their duplication as set forth in the applicable regulations,

Thank you for your professional assistance in this matter.

With kind regards, ] am

Ryan Oxford, Legal Assistant to
Ayesha T. Washington

ATW/mrh

0770672011 12:17PM
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July 18, 2011

Ms. Ryan Oxford

Pierce, Herns, Sloan & McLeod, LLC
The Blake House

321 East Bay Street

Charleston, SC 29401

Re: FOIA Request — Medicaid Cost Reports for Heartland of West Ashley

Dear Ms. Oxford:
In response to your Freedom of Information Act request, enclosed you will find the
applicable cost reports you requested. The documents provided are true and accurate
copies of reports. collected by the Department in the regular course of its business.
Our expense for reproducing and mailing this information is twenty-four and 50/100
dollars ($24.50). Please make the check payable to the Department of Health and Human
Services and send it to:

Department of Health and Human Services

Department of Receivables

Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, SC 29202-8297

[ hope this information is helpful to you. Please contact me if there are any questions.

Sincerely,

Richard G. Hepfer
Deputy General Counsel

RGH/h
Enclosures
cc: Lynette D. Wilson, Receivables

Office of General Counsel
P.O. Box 8206  Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2795 » Fax (803) 255-8210



