Amanda Schultz <aschultz@wexfordplantation.com>
Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov
3/13/2014 2:30:23 PM

FW: PSAV + Cups

Just FYI, I am available until 4 today, but may be in & out of the office. If I miss you I will return your call as soon as | can!

From: Amanda Schultz

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2014 12:31 PM
To: 'Veldran, Katherine'

Subject: RE: PSAV + Cups

Great, talk to you then! Feel free to call my office (843) 715-0913 at your convenience! J

From: Veldran, Katherine [mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2014 10:25 AM

To: Amanda Schultz

Subject: RE: PSAV + Cups

Let's schedule a call for 2:00pm.
Thank you,
Katherine

From: Amanda Schultz [mailto:aschultz@wexfordplantation.com]
Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2014 10:24 AM

To: Veldran, Katherine

Subject: Re: PSAV + Cups

I do at 2 or 3 pm if that works?

Amanda Schultz

Special Events Coordinator
Food & Beverage Supervisor
Wexford Plantation

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 13, 2014, at 10:22 AM, "Veldran, Katherine" <KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Do you have a time for a call?
KV

From: Amanda Schultz [mailto:aschultz@wexfordplantation.com]
Sent: Saturday, March 08, 2014 4:32 PM

To: Veldran, Katherine

Subject: FW: PSAV + Cups

Sorry, just spoke with Casey/Sarah and they let me know they already spoke with you re: cups! I've been out
of the office all week so was unaware! Please ignore 3 Talk soon.

From: Amanda Schultz

Sent: Saturday, March 08, 2014 12:02 PM
To: KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov

Cc: Elise Witman; Sarah Smith; Susan Fishel
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Subject: PSAV + Cups

Hi Katherine,

So nice seeing you last week! We are just finalizing some details regarding the food stations and should be
getting that proposal to you mid-week. Elise and | are also compiling several centerpiece ideas & costs. As far
as the AV equipment goes, | just wanted to touch base with you about your meeting with them last Friday to
see if there was any discussion about using the equipment for both of your events?

Because | wanted to reserve these items as soon as possible due to it being Heritage week, 1 did touch base
with David Delaney to make sure all of the equipment needed was available and it is at this time. An updated
quote for this year is attached. | did get him to adjust the price of the wireless microphones to match last
year's price of the wired microphones after his initial proposal; however, | have not mentioned anything
about doubling your events as | wanted to speak with you first.

Keep in mind that we do have a projector that you are welcome to use if you want to eliminate that cost. I'm
not sure if it's as fancy as theirs, but we use it for all of our meetings and it works just fine for us! J

I've also attached the quote for the logo cups. If we use the same design as last year, there will be a $40
discount, and if we change the design/logo, the amount will remain the same as last year.

Hope you have a great weekend, and talk to you soon!
Amanda Schultz
Special Events Coordinator

Wexford Plantation
111 Wexford Club Drive

Hilton Head Island, SC 29928

(843) 715-0913

aschultz@wexfordplantation.com
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