

INTERNAL STAFF UPDATE*

January 4, 2016

One SC:

Donations from November 17th, the day following the Governor's One SC press conference, through December 30th total \$700,107.00.

Legislative:

The "2016 Legislative Workshop for the Media" will be on Thursday morning at 9:30 a.m. A copy of the agenda is attached.

MERRY 11TH DAY OF CHRISTMAS!



**This document is a transitory and temporary record created for short-term internal purposes that includes informal materials that do not record decisions.*

AGENDA
2016 LEGISLATIVE WORKSHOP FOR THE MEDIA

Sponsored by:

South Carolina Press Association, South Carolina Broadcasters Association, Associated Press
9:30 a.m., Thursday, January 7, 2016
Room 112, Solomon Blatt Building, Columbia, South Carolina

9:30 – 9:45 **Registration and Opening Remarks**
Moderator – Lee Harter, Executive Editor, Orangeburg Times & Democrat

ALL COMMENTS ARE ON THE RECORD.

9:45 – 10:15 **Overview of numbers on revenue and spending projections**
Les Boles, State Budget Director

10:15 – 12:00 **Morning Roundtable Budget Discussion:**
Topics: **OVERVIEW OF BUDGET**
 ABBEVILLE LAWSUIT/EDUCATION REFORM
 FLOOD RECOVERY/TRANSPORTATION INFRASTRUCTURE

11:45-12:00 **Q&A**

Panelists:	Sen. Harvey Peeler	Rep. Gary Simrill
	Sen. Thomas Alexander	Rep. Gilda Cobb-Hunter
	Sen. Brad Hutto	Rep. Rita Allison
	Sen. Paul Campbell	Rep. Kenny Bingham
	Sen. Tom Davis	Rep. Jackie Hayes
	Sen. Greg Hembree	

12:00-1:00 **LUNCH - Welcome & Q&A – President Pro Tem Hugh Leatherman; Speaker Jay Lucas**

1:00-2:30 **Afternoon Roundtable Discussion**
Topics: **ABBEVILLE LAWSUIT**
 TRANSPORTATION REFORM
 LEGISLATIVE OVERSIGHT
 FOIA REFORM
 ETHICS REFORM

2:15-2:30 **Q&A**

Panelists:	Sen. Larry Martin	Rep. Tommy Pope
	Sen. Brad Hutto	Rep. Gary Simrill
	Sen. Chip Campsen	Rep. Gary Clary
	Sen. Shane Massey	Rep. Mandy Powers Norrell
	Sen. Thomas McElveen	Sen. Greg Hembree

**This document is a transitory and temporary record created for short-term internal purposes that includes informal materials that do not record decisions.*