
From: Soura, Christian
To: Boles, Les <LBoles@budget.sc.gov>
CC: Duncan, Debra <DDuncan@budget.sc.gov>

Baker, Josh <JoshBaker@gov.sc.gov>
Date: 11/26/2013 2:06:01 PM

Subject: RE: Proviso 99.12 Adjutant General Loan Outstanding

                Got it – thanks again for your help.
 
CLS
 
 
Christian L. Soura
Deputy Chief of Staff
 
(803) 543-0792
ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov
 
From: Boles, Les 

Sent: Tuesday, November 26, 2013 2:02 PM

To: Soura, Christian

Cc: Duncan, Debra

Subject: Proviso 99.12 Adjutant General Loan Outstanding
 
Christian,
 
The Adjutant General’s office has told us the outstanding balance is $950,000, HOWEVER they are planning to pay the 
loan off this year.  The agency sent a SCEIS document through in October but it was rejected due to coding errors.  
We have been told they will process the transaction next week.  We will monitor and if the transaction goes through 
you can recommend deleting this proviso.  If the loan is not paid off by the time you finalize your book I would leave 
the proviso as-is.
 
Les
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