From: Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
To: Nabors, Robin <Robin.Nabors@admin.sc.gov>
CC: Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov>
Date:  5/2/2016 2:11:16 PM
Subject:  FW: Check needed for Corrigan
Attachments: Invoice to South Carolina 10-17 - 12-23-15 - dated 1-30-16.docx

Robin — This is the payment we are trying to make sure has been sent to Justice Corrigan. Last we heard, the
payment had been processed by Admin and sent to the CG. Any update you can track down will be greatly
appreciated. Thank you.

From: Schimsa, Rebecca

Sent: Wednesday, April 20, 2016 6:19 PM
To: katherinehaltiwanger@gov.sc.gov
Subject: Check needed for Corrigan

Halti,

Attached is an invoice for services rendered in the matter, Michelle H. v. Haley, that need to be paid before we can
seek IRF reimbursement. Recall that our office splits fees for this suit with DSS. Once a check has been written,
please have a copy sent to me.

To: Maura D. Corrigan, Esq.

Amount: $2,738.75

For: Legal Services 10/17-12/23/2015

Address: Maura D. Corrigan, Esq.; 880 Bishop Road; Grosse Pointe Park, MI 48230

Thank you,

Rebecca

Rebecca S. Schimsa

Deputy Legal Counsel

Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
0: 803-734-6068 | C: 803-429-4561
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