Kremlick, Lindsey O

Lewis, Phleisha E <Phleisha.Lewis@SCDMV.net>
Adams, Marcia S <Marcia. Adams@SCDMV.net>
11/28/2007 8:12:55 AM

FW: Invitation

Phleisha,

Here is the email Fred sent to me. | was under the impression AAMVA was picking up our rooms. Do you want me to clarify
this Fred?

Thanks,
Lindsey

From: Porter, Fred [mailto:FPorter@aamva.org]
Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2007 11:50 AM
To: Lindsey.Kremlick@scdmv.net

Subject: RE: Invitation

Hi Lindsey,

Region Il will cover room and tax for Thursday for the primary host staff who need to be there early on Friday to meet with
the hotel or start making airport pick-ups. Everyone else is supposed to arrive on Friday. The contract is only for three rooms
on Thursday Night. I'm sure they will let us have two or three more if we need them, but basically it should be Marcia, you,
Wanda, Irene, me, and maybe Darius & Greg or whomever will be handling shuttling people from the two airports. Everyone
else should be able to come in on Friday Morning.

Let me know if that will pose problems for any of your staff.

Thanks!
FP

Fred Porter

Vice President

AAMVA Region Il Operations
1075 Cambridge Court
Benton, AR 72019

Phone: (501) 778-7099

Fax: (501) 778-8267

Mobile: (501) 590-4860
fporter@aamva.org

Have you registered for the 2007 Fall Workshop, Nov. 5-8 in Arizona? Visit www.aamva.org to register today!

From: Lindsey.Kremlick@scdmv.net [mailto:Lindsey.Kremlick@scdmv.net]
Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2007 10:31 AM

To: Porter, Fred

Subject: Invitation

Fred,

I am reading over the invitation one last time to double check everything, It says:

"AAMVA Region Il will pay for your room and taxes for the nights of January 10-12."

Does AAMVA pay for Thursday night as well?
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Thanks,

Lindsey Osborne Kremlick

SC Department of Motor Vehicles
Legislative Liaison

Special Projects Manager

Office: 803.896.5616

Fax: 803.896.9747

P.O. Box 1498

Blythewood, SC 29016



