
From: SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
To: JoAnn TurnquistJoAnn@yourfoundation.org

Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov
Date: 3/7/2016 1:12:26 PM

Subject: Re: One SC Fund

Hi Holly,
It is close to 590,000 once you subtract all grant allocations, and other expenses. 
Thanks!
Dana
 

Sent from Outlook Mobile

On Mon, Mar 7, 2016 at 9:44 AM -0800, "Pisarik, Holly" <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov> wrote:
 

Can ya’ll tell me quickly the fund balance after the most recent awards.
 
Holly G. Pisarik
Chief Legal Counsel
Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
O: 803-734-8465 C: 803-322-6255
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