
From: Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
To: Haltiwanger, Katherine <KatherineHaltiwanger@gov.sc.gov>
CC: Patel, Swati <SwatiPatel@gov.sc.gov>

Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov>
Date: 12/17/2015 2:43:47 PM

Subject: Extradition Assoc. membership
Attachments: SCJIS Bizhu15121609310.pdf

Halti,
 

Please have Finance send payment for the membership renewal to the National Association for 
Extradition Officials for the Governor's Extradition Coordinator, Anita Scott. Attached is the 
appropriate paperwork.
 

Check Amount: 
 
$500.00
 

Payable To: 
 
National Association of Extradition Officials (NAEO)
 

Send To: 
 
NAEO, c/o Nicole Kellogg, Extradition Officer
 
Department of Corrections
 
2605 State Street, Residence #3
 
Salem, Oregon 97310
 

Thank you,
 

Rebecca
 

-----Original Message-----
 
From: Scott, Anita [mailto:ascott@sled.sc.gov] 
 
Sent: Wednesday, December 16, 2015 11:57 AM
 
To: Schimsa, Rebecca
 
Subject: RE: Are you available 
 

I Have a membership renewal for National Association for Extradition Officials. I can get you the 
original if needed. 
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