Taylor, Richele

Symmes, Brian <BrianSymmes@gov.sc.gov>
10/24/2016 3:49:19 PM

RE: Dollars

Yes. We will get an updated today and tomorrow. | will provide both so you can use the most recent you receive.

From: Symmes, Brian

Sent: Monday, October 24, 2016 3:41 PM
To: Taylor, Richele

Subject: FW: Dollars

Can you get the numbers below updated before the event on Wednesday? | need to be able to give it to the governor
as background information.

Thanks.

Brian

From: Adams, Chaney

Sent: Monday, October 24, 2016 1:05 PM
To: Symmes, Brian

Subject: FW: Dollars

From: Taylor, Richele

Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2016 10:58 AM
To: Adams, Chaney

Cc: Haltiwanger, Katherine

Subject: Dollars

Chaney,

Here are the totals. | am copying Halti in case this is helpful for her too to have.

$1,940,229.05 October 5, 2015-October 3, 2016

482,500 Sponsorship for Concert collected

$55,996.77 Individuals donating since Hurricane

$82,500 Sponsorships pledged for Concert, but not yet
received

$100,000 Company pledges since hurricane, but not yet
received

To date:

Total Dollars Received and Pledged: $2,661,225.82
Total Dollars Received without pledges: $2,478,725.82
Richele K. Taylor

Chief Legal Counsel
Office of the Governor
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