
From: Amy Duffy <aduffy@scprt.com>
To: Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov

Date: 8/13/2013 3:03:13 PM 
Subject: FW: Laminator

Attachments: 20130809084550702.pdf

Here you go!

Amy Duffy
Chief of Staff 
SCPRT

From: Yvette Sistare
Sent: Friday, August 09, 2013 8:43 AM
To: Amy Duffy
Subject: Laminator

Attached is the invoice from the Gov's Office where we reimbursed for the laminator.

Yvette Sistare
Finance Director
South Carolina Department of 

Parks, Recreation, & Tourism
1205 Pendleton Street
Suite 517
Columbia, South Carolina 29201 
Phone: (803)734-1759 
Mobile: (803) 622-1229 
Fax: (803) 734-0671
Email: YSistare@scprt.com
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