
From: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>
To: Van Cleave, Jennifer <jvancleave@aging.sc.gov>

Pondy, Kevin <pondyk@aging.sc.gov>
Rivers, Denise <riversd@aging.sc.gov>
Ford, Elizabeth <meford@aging.sc.gov>
Wolf, Anne <awolf@aging.sc.gov>
Zavoras, Catherine <cZavoras@aging.sc.gov>
Shavo, Katherine <kshavo@aging.sc.gov>

CC: Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>

Date: 11/21/2014 11:22:05 AM
Subject: FW: R7 PD REVISED Multi-grant PRF-October 2014 with supporting documentation

Attachments: R7 PD Revised Payment Request Form(October 2014).pdf
R7 PD LG106alzn-October 2014.pdf
R7 PD LG106en-October 2014.pdf
R7 PD LG106rnrn-October 2014.pdf
R7 PD MUSR-AAR-RNR-October 2014.pdf
R7 PD MUSR-HCBS-October 2014.pdf
R7 PD MUSR-IIIb-d-October 2014.pdf
R7 PD MUSR-IIIE-October 2014.pdf

This is their revision:
 
Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs.  The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare 
(K:\\PSA\\PRFs\\FY15\\Pee Dee).
 
Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection.  Please respond ASAP.
 
 
From: Mark Smith [mailto:Mark.Smith@caresouth-carolina.com] 

Sent: Friday, November 21, 2014 11:16 AM

To: Finance Help, Aging

Cc: Shelia Welch; Mark Smith

Subject: R7 PD REVISED Multi-grant PRF-October 2014 with supporting documentation

Importance: High
 
Attached is the revised payment request and supporting documentation for October. Thank you for letting me know what 
corrections needed to be made. If this is still incorrect, please let me know. I am pretty sure I got it right now but if not, let me 
know and I will be happy to adjust accordingly.
 
Thank you once again.
 
Mark Smith, Fiscal Analyst
Vantage Point,a division of CareSouth Carolina, Inc.
Pee Dee Regional Aging and Disability Resource Center
843-383-8632 Office
843-383-8754 Fax
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This message is intended for the use of the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information, including health information, that is privileged, 
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confidential, and the disclosure of which is governed by applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent 
responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this information is STRICTLY 
PROHIBITED.


If you have received this in error, please notify us immediately and destroy the related message.
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