6/20/2018 3:01:54 PM
Re: Fw: Cost Accounting Forms - 1st Quarter 2018

Can | mail these to Catherine?

Sincerely,
Kevin

Kevin L. Bryant

Lieutenant Governor of South Carolina
104-A North Avenue

Anderson, South Carolina 29625

On Wed, Jun 20, 2018 at 2:46 PM, Danny Varat < > wrote:
Here's the Q1 bill.

From: Weis, Jeremy John < >
Sent: Tuesday, June 19, 2018 3:48 PM

To: Danny Varat

Subject: Cost Accounting Forms - 1st Quarter 2018

Danny

The cost accounting forms for the First Quarter 2018 are attached. Please let me know if any changes need to be made.
Upon your approval, | will send them on to the appropriate agencies for billing. Thanks.

SLED - $922.51 (includes estimated overtime charges)
DPS - $147.52
Total - $1070.03

S/A Jeremy Weis

Executive Protection Unit

South Carolina Law Enforcement Division
4400 Broad River Road

Columbia, SC 29210

Main - 803-737-9000

Mobile - 803-260-0848

Email -


mailto:Bryant,%20Kevin%20%3Ckevin@kevinbryant.com%3E
mailto:DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov
http://www.kevinbryant.com
mailto:DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov
mailto:jweis@sled.sc.gov
mailto:jweis@sled.sc.gov

