From: Cindy Alewine <calewine@alz.org>
To: Kester, Tonykester@aging.sc.gov
CC: Wolf, Anneawolf@aging.sc.gov
Ellison, Ruchellerellison@aging.sc.gov
Sam Wileyswiley@alz.org
Date: 10/29/2014 2:32:14 PM
Subject:  Re: DMH Respite Check - Who can | talk with in Finance ?

Works great! | should have the check in the mail by tomorrow afternoon.
Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 29, 2014, at 2:22 PM, Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov> wrote:

Cindy,

A wire transfer is possible in the future. The process can take several weeks to complete. | think it would be
best, and easier, to mail the first check and start the process for future transfers.

Does that sound OK?

Tony Kester

Aging Director

South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350

Columbia, SC 29201

Phone 803-734-9910, Fax 803-734-9886
kester@aging.sc.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or otherwise protected from
disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this electronic mail or its contents by persons other
than the intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately
by reply email so that we may correct our internal records. Please then delete the original message.

From: Wolf, Anne

Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2014 1:51 PM

To: 'Cindy Alewine'

Cc: Sam Wiley; Kester, Tony

Subject: RE: DMH Respite Check - Who can | talk with in Finance ?

Hi Cindy,

Our Finance manager is Ruchelle Ellison. She is out this afternoon but I've copied Tony as to the question re:
wire transfer.

Thanks,
Anne

From: Cindy Alewine [mailto:calewine@alz.org]

Sent: Wednesday, October 29, 2014 11:20 AM

To: Wolf, Anne

Cc: Sam Wiley

Subject: DMH Respite Check - Who can | talk with in Finance ?
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Hi Anne,

We finally received the DMH respite check for the first quarter of this fiscal year. | want to get these funds
194,676.50 to LGOA as soon as possible. Is there someone | could talk with and possibly wire transfer the
money to finance?

Thanks,
Cindy

Cindy Alewine | CEO/President | Alzheimer's Association, South Carolina Chapter |
office: 864-622-0572 | 24-hour helpline: 800-272-3900 | calewine@alz.org | www.alz.org/sc
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