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1(3/29/2011) Brenda James - FOIA - Fw: Fwd: Medicaid Nursing Facility Question

From: Bryan Kost

To: Brenda James

Date; 3/28/2011 11:01 AM

Subject: FOIA - Fw: Fwd: Medicaid Nursing Facility Question (Forward from Info ID)

Attachments: Fwd: Medicaid Nursing Facility Question (Forward from Info ID)

RECEIVED)
MAR 2.9 2011

Department of Health & Human Servicas
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR
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From: "Meadows, Elizabeth Brown" <elizabeth.b.meadows@Vanderbilt. Edu>
To: "info@scdhhs.gov" <info@scdhhs.gov>

Date: 3/28/2011 10:56 AM

Subject: Medicaid Nursing Facility Question

Hi,

I am doing research for a small healthcare law firm looking to expand. Could | be provided with the
average Medicaid reimbursement rate for nursing facilities within South Carolina? Thank you.

Best,

Elizabeth B. Meadows WMﬁmHé\mw

Candidate for Doctor of Jurisprudence, 2011
Vanderbilt University Law School

444 Elmington Avenue, Apt 632 MAR 29 2011
Nashville, TN 37205
Email: elizabeth.b.meadows@vanderbilt.edu Department of Heelth & Human Services

Phone: (256) 749-2720 OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR
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TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour , Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs
Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

¥ € hH hH & B

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs
South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297
Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any
questions. .

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P.O. Box 8206 * Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 « Fax (803) 255-8235
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Janet Bell - Fwd: Medicaid Nursing Facility Question ;

o
From: Elizabeth Hutto
To: elizabeth.b.meadows@vanderbilt.Edu
Date: 1/4/2012 1:43 PM
Subject; Fwd: Medicaid Nursing Facility Question
cC: Janet Bell

Attachments: Copy of FOIA request dated 3-28-11 from Elizabeth Meadows.pdf

I am resending the email that was sent to you on December 14, 2011, to make sure that the information you
requested is no longer needed or that you did receive it.

We received no response regarding your request, so we are just following up. Thanks so much for your time.

Elizabeth Hutto 12/14/2011 11:03 AM >>>

Attached is a request from you to us dated 3/28/11. We cannot find that this was answered. If we replied, would
you please forward a copy of the email that was sent to you back. Also, if we did not answer your request, do
you still need the information? If this was not answered, please except our apology. Thanks so much for your
help and understanding.

Elizabeth "Faye" Hutto

Administrative Coordinator

Reimbursement Methodology

SC Department of Health and Human Services
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