1/21/2003 10:22:48 AM
RE: FW: Special Plate Fee Recovery

Not from all plates, only the plates that do not have a special plate fee assigned, then SGF & SHF will participate (ie, plates
listed on your email list sent to me) Tejal

From: Randy Borth [mailto:rborth@hg.caci.com]
Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2003 9:15 AM

To: Joshi, Tejal

Subject: Re: FW: Special Plate Fee Recovery

Will we have to take cost recovery from the SGF & SHF funds from all plates, or only the plates that do not have any
other special fees? | guess we can discuss it at our meeting tomorrow.

- Randy

"Joshi, Tejal" <Joshi_Tejal@scdps.state.
sc.us> To: "rborth@hg.caci.com™ <rborth@caci.com>
cc:  "Adams, Marcia S." <Adams_MarciaS@scdps.state.sc.us>, "Burgis, David" <Burgis_Davi

01/21/03 09:05 AM state.sc.us>
Subject: FW: Special Plate Fee Recovery

Hi Randy,

Your email list of special plates and cost recovery ? will be answered per
Gwen"s opinion. SGF and SHF will have to participate in cost recovery per
below for all special plates.

From: Green, Gwendolyn [mailto:gwendolyngreen@scdps.net]
<mailto:[mailto:gwendolyngreen@scdps.net]>

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2003 5:12 PM

To: Joshi, Tejal; Dolder, Rolf P.

Cc: Caldwell, John H.; Burgis, David

Subject: Special Plate Fee Recovery

Sorry, this took me so long. JJ Gentry now states that he recalls that it
was the intent of the legislature for DMV to have all fees. 1 reviewed
section 56-3-8100. My legal opinion is that section (D) stands alone. DMV
is entitled to cost recovery for all plates designated as special plates. No
distinctions!
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