
From: Jeremy Borden <borden.jeremy@gmail.com>
To: Schimsa, RebeccaRebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov
CC: Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov

Date: 3/4/2016 8:37:17 AM
Subject: Re: Revised Cost Estimate

All,

I hope this finds you well! It has been nearly two months since my deposit and nearly six months 
since my initial inquiry. Can I expect this FOI to be complied with? 

I expected a much quicker turnaround given my deposit and the more limited scope we agreed on.

Please let me know ASAP whether you intend to honor this request, I would like to move forward. If 
not, please let me know what the reason is and return the deposit immediately. 

Thank you,

Jeremy 

On Tue, Jan 19, 2016 at 5:20 PM, Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Mr. Borden,

 

We are still compiling records.  As soon as we can, we will let you know.

 

Thank you,

Rebecca

 

From: Jeremy Borden [mailto:borden.jeremy@gmail.com] 
 
Sent: Thursday, January 14, 2016 1:26 PM
 
To: Schimsa, Rebecca
 
Cc: Pisarik, Holly

Subject:  Re: Revised Cost Estimate

 

Hi all,

 

I was wondering when I could expect the FOI documents. Please let me know and thanks so much!
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Jeremy  

 

On Fri, Jan 8, 2016 at 6:05 PM, Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Mr. Borden,

 

Please see attached for receipt of deposit.

 

Sincerely,

 

Rebecca

 

From: Jeremy Borden [mailto:borden.jeremy@gmail.com] 
 
Sent: Monday, January 04, 2016 12:30 PM
 
To: Schimsa, Rebecca; Pisarik, Holly
 
Subject: Re: Revised Cost Estimate

 

I mailed the $100 deposit have you received it? I'd prefer to pick up the documents if they are not 
emailed here, please let me know when they are available. When do you think that will be?

 

Thanks for all your help!

 

Jeremy 

 

On Tue, Dec 15, 2015 at 2:27 PM, Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Mr. Borden,

 

Please see attached.

 

Thank you,

 

Rebecca
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Rebecca S. Schimsa

Deputy Legal Counsel

Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley

O: 803-734-6068 | C: 803-429-4561

 

One SC Flood Relief Fund – www.onescfund.org
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