Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov
6/13/2018 10:37:50 AM

Re: Question

10-4

From: Catherine McNicoll

Sent: Wednesday, June 13, 2018 10:33 AM
To: Danny Varat

Subject: FW: Question

Best Regards,

Catherine McNicoll

Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicol | @SCSatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: MarlaWalker [mailto:marla.walker1993@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, June 08, 2018 9:10 AM

To: Catherine McNicall

Subject: Re: Question

| know...20 some years))))

Thanks. Maybe they will just credit our account.
Thanks for your help.

Marla

On Fri, Jun 8, 2018 at 8:58 AM, Catherine McNicoll <CatherineM cNicoll @scstatehouse.gov> wrote:

Best Regards,

Catherine McNicoll

Director of Legal & Legidative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicol | @SCSatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: MarlaWalker [mailto:marla.walker1993@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, June 07, 2018 3:17 PM

To: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineM cNicoll @scstatehouse.gov>

Subject: Re: Question

Yes. Now | have adilemma....l talked to a gal and she negotiated away the penalty and interest and we are
about to send a check for $25 which was the original amount.
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When | told the bookkeeper, she said the accountant said he didn't think it was worth calling and paid it! He
didn't tell me.

I'm hoping if we send in the $25, they will return his payment (so he doesn't bill us!)
Thanks,
Marla

On Thu, Jun 7, 2018 at 2:37 PM, Catherine McNicoll <CatherineM cNicoll @scstatehouse.gov> wrote:

I’ve heard from DOR early this week, they say they have been in contact since our last exchange. Has there been
any movement? Thank you.

Best Regards,

Catherine McNicoll

Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll @SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: MarlaWalker [mailto:marlawalker1993@gmail .com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 22, 2018 4:28 PM

To: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineM cNicoll @scstatehouse.gov>
Subject: Re: Question
Haven't heard aword or received anything in the mail.

Marla Walker

On Tue, May 22, 2018 at 4:02 PM, Catherine McNicoll <CatherineM cNicoll @scstatehouse.gov> wrote:

| wanted to follow up and seeif DOR has sufficiently worked through this? Thank you.

Best Regards,

Catherine McNicall

Director of Legal & Legidlative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNi coll @SCSatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: MarlaWalker [mailto:marla.wa ker1993@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, May 11, 2018 12:45 PM

To: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll @scstatehouse.gov>
Subject: Re: Question

Would appreciate your help, thanks.

Notice attached.

Marla Walker

On Fri, May 11, 2018 at 10:33 AM, Catherine McNicoll <CatherineM cNicoll @scstatehouse.gov>
wrote:
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Good Morning Marla,

| would like to reach out to our contact at SC DOR to seeif they can help sort this out. Please let me know if
you are okay with me contacting them. Most likely what will happen is| will contact them and they will
have someone call you to get the information and then review the situation. We can’t guarantee that this will
help, but it’s the best way we can assist.

Best Regards,

Catherine McNicoll

Director of Legal & Legidlative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNi coll @SCSatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: Bryant, Kevin [mailto:kevin@kevinbryant.com]

Sent: Friday, May 11, 2018 9:28 AM

To: MarlaWalker <marlawalker1993@gmail.com>; Catherine McNicoll

<CatherineMcNicoll @scstatehouse.gov>; Danny Varat <DannyV arat@scstatehouse.gov>

Subject: Re: Question

Good to hear from you Marla. | have included our Columbia office in this e-mail. Maybe they can
help find some information as to how you need to proceed.

Sincerely,
Kevin

Kevin L. Bryant

Lieutenant Governor of South Carolina
104-A North Avenue

Anderson, South Carolina 29625
www.kevinbryant.com

On Mon, May 7, 2018 at 12:11 PM, Marla Walker <marla.walker1993@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi,

as of thefirst of April we have been helping and supporting an domestic abuse victim and her 16
month old daughter. AIM and several friends have helped, but none of the other services.

My question is how the SC Department of Revenue can send us abill for Ken Walker, Inc., that is
from 12/1996 tax year? They say we owed $25 and with penalties and interest, the total is now
$97.27.

We do not or are required to keep records that long, so we have no way to disputeit.

Not sure who to ask about this.

Thanks,

Marla

MarlaD. Walker, Associate Broker
Anderson Homes of South Caroling, Inc.
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