
From: Herring, Courtney <Courtney.Herring@CVSHealth.com>
To: Danny VaratDannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov

Date: 9/28/2017 10:18:02 AM
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Re: Med Return Grant

We have not confirmed process yet. I should know more today.
 

Courtney Herring  │Regional Director, Government Affairs
 
p 843-327-7874 │c 803-463-6375
CVS Health

On Sep 28, 2017, at 9:38 AM, Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov> wrote:
 

​Courtney, thanks again for your help on this. Let me clarify before I talk to Jarrod, but is it the 
case that if this information is collected for each agency, then CVS will process the grants and 
deliver the boxes? Thanks


DV


From: Herring, Courtney <Courtney.Herring@CVSHealth.com>
 
Sent: Wednesday, September 27, 2017 11:49 AM
 
To: Danny Varat
 
Subject: Med Return Grant 
 
 

 

Courtney Herring  │Regional Director, Government Affairs
p 843-327-7874 │c 803-463-6375 
 
CVS Health  

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This communication and any attachments may contain confidential and/or privileged information for the use of the designated recipients 
named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you have received this communication in error and that any review, disclosure, 
dissemination, distribution or copying of it or its contents is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by email or 
telephone and destroy all copies of this communication and any attachments.
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