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Linda Malone - Fwd: Request for Public Records . . Page 1

From: Jeff Stensland D<- m\%
To: Malone, Linda : W
Date: 1/16/2007 1:54:31 PM HJ}
Subject: Fwd: Request for Public Records W ﬂo

Please log this FOI request

Jeff Stensland ﬁ ﬁ P \m

SC DHHS

(803) 898-2584 m -

CC: Bowling, Susan



m Linda Malone - Request for Public Records _ _ _ Page E

From: <kkim@gmcf.org>

To: _ <stensland@scdhhs.gov>
Date: 1/16/2007 1:21:05 PM
Subject: Request for Public Records

January 17, 2006

RE: REQUEST FOR PUBLIC RECORDS

To Jeff Stensland:

We are making a Request for Public Records related to the "Quality
Improvement / Medical Utilization Review for Medicaid Beneficiaries and
Providers" contract. We understand that this contract was awarded to
Qualis Health on November 3, 2006 (award #07-S7205-A12760). We are
interested in obtaining copies of the RFP and proposals from all bidders
related to the procurement.

Since the volume of materials related to this request is unknown to us

at this time, please provide a general cost estimate to me prior to

fulfilling this request. If you have questions or need additional

information from me, please feel free to contact me via phone at
678-527-3614 or E-mail at kkim@gmcf.org. Thank you for your assistance
related to this request.

Sincerely,

Karen Kim
Business Development and Strategic Planning

Georgia Medical Care Foundation

Karen Kim

gmcf



Linda Malone - Request for Public Records - .. _.uwcm 2

1435 Lincoln Parkway

Suite 800

Atlanta, GA 30346

www.gmcf.org <http://www.gmcf.org>

email: kkim@gmcf.org

office: 678-527-3614

mobile: 404-849-4116

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail and any attached files transmitted may contain confidential and
privileged information and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which they are
addressed. If you are not the intended recipient or the person responsible for delivering the e-mail to the
intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail and any attached files in error and that
any use, dissemination, forwarding, printing or copying of this e-mail and /or any attached files is strictly

prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please immediately notify the sender and destroy the
original message and any attached files.



State of South Carolina
Bepartment of Health and Hinman Serfiices

Mark Sanford Robert M. Kerr
Govemnor Director

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

@ LH &6 ©H A A

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235
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[ (1/19/2007) Marie Brown - Request Tor Pu icRecords — T e _Page ]

From: Byron Roberts

To: kkim@gmcf.org

Date: 1/19/2007 11:18 AM
Subject: Request for Public Records
CC: stensland@scdhhs.gov
Dear Ms. Kim,

This is in response to your email request to Jeff Stensland for information related to the
"Quality Improvement / Medicaid Utilization Review for Medicaid Beneficiaries and
Providers" contract. A Notice of Intent to Award the contract to Qualis Health was posted
on October 26, 2006. However, a protest was filed prior to the contract becoming effective
and the award has not become official. For any further information, including copies of

proposals related to the procurement, please direct your request (with reference to
Solicitation No: 06-S7205) to:

Deborah Martin

Materials Management Office
1201 Main Street - Suite 600
Columbia, SC 29201
DKMartin@mmo.State.SC.US

If you have questions or need additional information, please contact me at 803-898-
2795 or email at robertsb@scdhhs.gov.

Sincerely,

Byron R. Roberts

Assistant General Counsel
South Carolina Department of
Health and Human Services



Linda Malone - Fwd: Request for Public Records S ) ~ Page 1

From: Jeff Stensland % D M\ w%y(
To: Malone, Linda W
Date: 1/16/2007 1:54:31 PM H.}
Subject: Fwd: Request for Public Records W ﬂ@

Please log this FOI request

Jeff Stensland ﬁﬁ ) \m
SC DHHS

(803) 898-2584

cC: Bowling, Susan
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From: <kkim@gmcf.org> ) .
To: <stensland@scdhhs.gov>
Date: 1/16/2007 1:21:05 PM
Subject: Request for Public Records RECEIVED ¢,

JAN 1 7 2007 »

SC Dept. of Health &
Human Serv. Office
e zounsel

RE: REQUEST FOR PUBLIC RECORDS h.._f..q/wd.i_..//u.“..
Y,

January 17, 2006

To Jeff Stensland:

We are making a Request for Public Records related to the "Quality
Improvement / Medical Utilization Review for Medicaid Beneficiaries and
Providers” contract. We understand that this contract was awarded to
Qualis Health on November 3, 2006 (award #07-S7205-A12760). We are
interested in obtaining copies of the RFP and proposals from all bidders
related to the procurement.

Since the volume of materials related to this request is unknown to us

at this time, please provide a general cost estimate to me prior to

fulfilling this request. If you have questions or need additional

information from me, please feel free to contact me via phone at
678-527-3614 or E-mail at kkim@gmcf.org. Thank you for your assistance
related to this request.

Sincerely,

Karen Kim
Business Development and Strategic Planning

Georgia Medical Care Foundation

Karen Kim

gmcf



Linda Malone - Request for Public Records ] ‘ Page 2

1455 Lincoln Parkway

Suite 800

Atlanta, GA 30346

www.gmcf.org <http://www.gmcf.org>

email: kkim@gmcf.org

office: 678-527-3614

mobile: 404-849-4116

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail and any attached files transmitted may contain confidential and
privileged information and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which they are
addressed. If you are not the intended recipient or the person responsible for delivering the e-mail to the
intended recipient, be advised that you have received this e-mail and any attached files in error and that
any use, dissemination, forwarding, printing or copying of this e-mail and /or any attached files is strictly

prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please immediately notify the sender and destroy the
original message and any attached files.



State of South Qaroling
Bepartment of Health and Hinman Serfrices

Mark Sanford Robert M. Kerr
Govemor Director

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:
Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages

Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

@#B A P A &

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



