
From: SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
To: Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov
CC: JoAnn TurnquistJoAnn@yourfoundation.org

Date: 12/1/2015 1:46:56 PM
Subject: RE: Real time report

Attachments: Governor Report (12.1.15).XLSX

Hi Holly,
 
I’m sorry for the delayed response. JoAnn and I were in Sumter this morning for a long term recovery meeting. I have 
attached a donor report (checks) from 11/18 until today as well as an online report. I’ll send you a report every Friday 
moving forward.
 
The $10,000 is still reflected on the totals for the online link. The gentleman was refunded and we received his check 
yesterday (it is in the attached report). Taking it off the online totals requires the stamp of approval of a staff member 
that is out on vacation. Just back that online total down $10K for now please until we can get it removed.
 
I’ll send you a breakdown of the online report shortly but I wanted you to have this before your meeting.
 
Best,
Dana
 
Dana Bruce Fulmer
SC Flood Relief Fund
Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601
F. 803.799.6663
 
From: Pisarik, Holly [mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov] 
 
Sent: Tuesday, December 01, 2015 10:30 AM
 
To: SC Flood Fund
 
Subject: RE: Real time report
 
Hi Dana,  I just checked the online donation amount;  it’s at $28,315.  Have you backed out the $10,000 yet that you 
anticipate will be a check?
 
From: SC Flood Fund [mailto:scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org] 
 
Sent: Wednesday, November 25, 2015 10:34 AM
 
To: Pisarik, Holly
 
Cc: Heather Sherwin; JoAnn Turnquist
 
Subject: RE: Real time report
 
That total is actually $11,370 not $10K, but yes.
 
Dana Bruce Fulmer
SC Flood Relief Fund
Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601
F. 803.799.6663
 
From: Pisarik, Holly [mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov] 
 
Sent: Wednesday, November 25, 2015 10:19 AM
 
To: SC Flood Fund
 
Cc: Heather Sherwin; JoAnn Turnquist
 

mailto:SC%20Flood%20Fund%20%3Cscfloodfund@yourfoundation.org%3E
mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov
mailto:JoAnn@yourfoundation.org
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mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov


Subject: Re: Real time report

 
Plus the 10,000 that aren't reflected in the online giving. That was given prior to the link becoming operational? 
 
So, total is 435,007? 
 

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 25, 2015, at 9:40 AM, SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org> wrote:

Yes, the online credit card donations in the report you can pull up via the link is $15,007 once you 
subtract the $10K. The rest of the checks are outlined correctly.
 
Once JoAnn returns we can discuss the more detailed reports.
 
Dana Bruce Fulmer
SC Flood Relief Fund
Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601
F. 803.799.6663
 
From: Pisarik, Holly [mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov] 
 
Sent: Wednesday, November 25, 2015 8:29 AM
 
To: SC Flood Fund
 
Cc: Heather Sherwin; JoAnn Turnquist
 
Subject: Re: Real time report
 
Thanks, Dana. So is the below correct:
 
100,000 - McNair
300,000 - Richardson
10,000 - check
10,000 - credit card donations not reflected in online total
15,007 - credit card donations (less the 10,000 that will be subtracted) 
 

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 25, 2015, at 8:00 AM, SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org> wrote:

We did, Holly. However, you will see that total go down again as I called the donor and he 
preferred to write a check so that $300 of his donation would not go to credit card fees. 
 
Have a great Thanksgiving!
Dana

Sent from Outlook
 
 

On Tue, Nov 24, 2015 at 2:33 PM -0800, "Pisarik, Holly" <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

You all received a $10,000 donation today? 
 

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 19, 2015, at 11:44 AM, SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org> wrote:
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Holly,
 
Technology is truly magical. We now have a link that will give you the real 
time update of credit card donations to the fund. You can click on it anytime 
you wish! I will still let you know if specific committee members donate or 
when checks arrive in the mail, but this allows you to see the online donations 
to date. Note that some of these donations may  come as a result of our 
newsletters and correspondence. If you need specifics how many reference 
the press release or the Governor I can let you know.
 
https://yourfoundation.wufoo.com/reports/qf7dg9c0y6rfaz/       
 
-Dana
 
Dana Bruce Fulmer
SC Flood Relief Fund
Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601
F. 803.799.6663
 

https://yourfoundation.wufoo.com/reports/qf7dg9c0y6rfaz/

