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' (04/12/2017) Brenda James - Fwd: Cost Settlement Reports .w@_>mmncmmn
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From: Jan Polatty
To: Brenda James
Date: 04/12/2011 4:53 PM
Subject: Fwd: Cost Settlement Reports FOIA Request
Attachments: Cost Settlement Reports .WWQMH<NU
Please log - thanks, Jan. .
APR 12
>>> Jeff Stensland 4/12/2011 4.28 PM >>> R Na:
Let's file as an FOIA Department of Health &
Human Seryi

OFFICE OF THE O_mmo.ﬂm@m
Jeff Stensland
SC DHHS

(803) 898-2584
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From: <SCOTT.GRAVES@bluechoicesc.com>
To: <Stensland@scdhhs.gov>

Date: 04/12/2011 4:25 PM

Subject: Cost Settlement Reports

Hey Jeff,

Thanks for your voicemail the other day. | am emailing to request the most recent set of cost settlement reports

for the following hospitals:

Greenville Hospital System
Palmetto Health

AnMed Health

Piedmont Medica! Center

Medical University of South Carolina

Let me know if you need additional information. Thanks.

Scott Graves
Scott.Graves@bluechoicesc.com
W: 803-382-5114

M: 803-586-4957

RECEIVED)
APR 122011

Department of Health & Human Senvices
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR
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TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

€® &P L LA H &P

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs
South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297
Columbia, South-Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any
questions.

Signature Date:

‘" Finance and Administration
P.O. Box 8206 « Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 » Fax (803) 255-8235
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Elizabeth Hutto - Fwd: RE: FOIA request

From: Jeff Saxon
To: Elizabeth Hutto

Date: 4/21/2011 3:03 PM

Subject: Fwd: RE: FOIA request

Attachments: RE: FOIA request \
Please consider log #0469 completed. o\@/
Thanks Jeff |

W7
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Elizabeth Hutto - RE: FOIA request

From: <SCOTT.GRAVES@bluechoicesc.com>
To: <MORRISGD@scdhhs.gov>

Date: 4/21/2011 2:48 PM

Subject: RE: FOIA request

CC: <Saxon@scdhhs.gov>

Thank you, Gina. Confirming receipt of all 5 emails.

Scott Graves

Scott. Graves@bluechoicesc.com

W: 803-382-5114

M: 803-586-4957

From: Gina D Morris [mailto:MORRISGD@scdhhs.gov]
Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2011 10:48 AM

To: SCOTT GRAVES

Cc: Jeff Saxon

Subject: FOIA request

Scott,

Attached are the cost settlements you requested. And you should have received the Cost Report report files as
well. Please let me know if you have any questions or need anything additional.

Gina D. Morris

Division of Acute Care Reimbursement

SC Department of Health and Human Services
Phone (803) 898-1029

Fax (803) 255-8228

Confidentiality Note

This message is intended for the use of the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information,
including health information, that is privileged, confidential, and the disclosure of which is governed by applicable
law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible to deliver it to
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this information is
STRICTLY PROHIBITED.

If you have received this in error, please notify us immediately and destroy the related message.
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