
From: Ford, Elizabeth <meford@aging.sc.gov>
To: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Wolf, Anne <awolf@aging.sc.gov>

Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>
Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>

Date: 11/14/2014 9:45:37 AM 
Subject: RE: ARCC pay request-The ARK

Approved

-----Original Message-----
From: Finance Help, Aging
Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 9:04 AM
To: Ford, Elizabeth
Cc: Wolf, Anne; Ellison, Ruchelle; Kester, Tony
Subject: FW: ARCC pay request-The ARK

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare 
(K:\PSA\PRFs\FY15\The Ark).
Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond ASAP.

-----Original Message-----
From: Peg Lahmeyer [mailto:pklahmeyer@sc.rr.com]
Sent: Tuesday, November 04, 2014 1:14 PM
To: Finance Help, Aging
Subject: ARCC pay request-The ARK

Please see attached request.

Thank you!

Peg Lahmeyer
Executive Director, The ARK
206 Central Ave
Summerville, SC 29483
www.theARKofSC.org

843-832-2357 work
843-906-5241 cell
888-371-1892 fax
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