SC Flood Fund <scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org>
Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov

4/4/2016 3:59:47 PM

RE: check

Yes- first thing in the AM! We have about $534K in the fund after all expenses but I'll get you the
breakdown too.

Sent from Outlook Mobile

On Mon, Apr 4, 2016 at 12:57 PM -0700, "Pisarik, Holly" <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Yes, it was mailed last week. Can | get an update by tomorrow on totals. The Governor is visiting one of the One SC
rebuild sites on Wednesday, and she would like an update by then. Thanks and hope you and your family are feeling
better!

From: SC Flood Fund [mailto:scfloodfund@yourfoundation.org]
Sent: Monday, April 04, 2016 12:38 PM

To: Pisarik, Holly

Subject: check

Did you mail the check or should I pick it up today? | can come by at 1 pm.

Dana Bruce Fulmer

SC Flood Relief Fund

Central Carolina Community Foundation
P. 803.254.5601

F. 803.799.6663
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