From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Haley, Nikki

Monday, October 5, 2015 9:00 PM
Schimsa, Rebecca

Patel, Swati; Godfrey, Rob; Smith, Austin
Re: Fund for Gibson Family

Thanks. Keep me posted. Allison is concerned about ongoing needs for their daughter with special needs.

Sent from my iPad

On Oct 5, 2015, at 8:32 PM, Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Please see below.

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Nicholas, Wendy" <NicholasWB@scdot.org>

Date: October 5, 2015 at 7:31:49 PM EDT

To: "Schimsa, Rebecca (rebeccaschimsa@gov.sc.gov)" <rebeccaschimsa@gov.sc.gov>
Cc: "Hall, Christy A" <HallCA@scdot.org>

Subject: Fund for Gibson Family

The message below came from the referral from DNR — he has been excellent to work
with! Can you please share with the Governor?

If folks want to give contribution to LECSC, 2501 Heyward Street. Columbia SC 29205.
Gifts need to be clearly marked for "Gibson Family". We will receive, disburse and
acknowledge the gifts. LECSC is the law enforcement chaplaincy for SC. It's our 501c3.
100% of gifts will go to family.

Allison says they are working with Dunbar in Irmo. Don't have funeral info yet cause
waiting on autopsy tomorrow. Dunbar will know official info. Sounds like there will be
an evening visitation, followed by funeral next day at Bethany Methodist in Saluda. Just
don't know dates and times yet. Eric

J. Eric Skidmore

South Carolina Law Enforcement
Assistance Program

2501 Heyward Street

Columbia, SC 29205
803-252-2664
eskidmore@sled.sc.gov
www.scleap.org




