
From: Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
To: Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov

Date: 10/10/2017 9:35:04 AM
Subject: Re: Invoice for Darlington

​Ok


From: Catherine McNicoll
 
Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 9:06 AM
 
To: Danny Varat
 
Subject: RE: Invoice for Darlington 
 
That seems likely.
Best Regards,
Catherine McNicoll
Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: Danny Varat 
 
Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 9:06 AM
 
To: Catherine McNicoll 
Subject: Fw: Invoice for Darlington
 
​I only just noticed this, but the invoice is for one person. Shall we presume that this is for Ann and that he was 
comped?

From: Lily Cogdill
 
Sent: Tuesday, September 26, 2017 4:07 PM
 
To: Danny Varat
 
Subject: Invoice for Darlington 
 
The attached is an invoice for the LG from the Darlington Race. Please advise.
Lily
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