
From: Finance Help, Aging <financehelp@aging.sc.gov>
To: Watson, Dale <dwatson@aging.sc.gov>
CC: Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>

Kester, Tony <kester@aging.sc.gov>
Date: 11/10/2014 9:28:09 AM

Subject: FW: Copy of Payment Request #04 October 2014 R3 Catawba Administrative.xlsx 
Attachments: Copy of Payment Request #04 October 2014 R3 Catawba Administrative.pdf

Please review the attached PRF(s) for your programs. The PRFs can also be found on the groupshare 
(K:\\PSA\\PRFs\\FY15\\Catawba).

Please send an email once approved or rejected stating reason for rejection. Please respond ASAP.

From: Barbara Robinson [mailto:barbara.robinson@catawba-aging.com]
Sent: Friday, November 07, 2014 3:36 PM
To: Finance Help, Aging
Subject: Copy of Payment Request #04 October 2014 R3 Catawba Administrative.xlsx

To whom it may concern: Attached is payment request for R3 for Administrative Services. Barbara
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